
Minute Book 90 

MOUNTAIN BROOK CITY COUNCIL 
PRE-MEETING DISCUSSION 

NOVEMBER 12,2019 

The City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama met in public session in the Pre-council 
Room (A106) of City Hall at 6:30 p.m. on the 12th day of November, 2019. The Council President called the 
meeting to order and the roll was called with the following results: 

Present: Virginia C. Smith, Council President 
William S. Pritchard 111, Council President Pro Tempore 
Philip E. Black 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 
Stewart Welch 111, Mayor 

Absent: None 

Also present were City Attorney Whit Colvin, City Manager Sam Gaston and City Clerk Steven 
Boone. 

1. AGENDA 

1. Finance Committee appointment-Lloyd Shelton (Resolution No. 2019-1 74 was added to the 
formal meeting agenda.) 

2. Library Board appointment-Lindsy Gardner (Resolution No. 20 19- 173 was added to the fonnal 
meeting agenda.) 

3. Inter-City Recycling Challenge-Alice Woinack (Appendix 1 ) 

4. Canterbury Park playground equipment-Shanda Williams (Resolution No. 201 9-175 was added 
to the formal meeting agenda.) 

5. Beech Street bollards and traffic control-Steve Stine (Appendix 2) 

6. Also, added to the formal meeting agenda were Resolution Nos. 20 19- 17 1 (re-establish the 
Payroll Specialist position for the Finance Department) and 201 9-1 72 (create an Administrative 
Assistant position for the Revenue Department) 

7. Review of the other matters to be considered at the formal (7 p.m.) meeting 

2. EXECUTIVE SESSION AND ADJOURNMENT 

Council President Smith made a motion that the City Council convene in executive session to discuss 
a real estate matter and another matter involving good name and character of an individual. The motion was 
seconded by Council President Pro Tempore Pritchard. Then, upon the question being put and the roll called, 
the vote was recorded as follows: 

Ayes: Virginia C. Smith, Council President 
William S. Pritchard 111, Council President Pro Tempore 
Philip E. Black 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 

November 12,20 19 



1200 Minute Book 90 

Nays: None 

Council President Smith declared that the motion passed by a vote of 5-0 and then requested that the 
audience members be excused and announced that the City Council shall convene in the Council Chamber at 7 
p.m. upon conclusion of the executive session. Council President Smith then adjourned the pre-meeting at 
approximately 6 5 0  p.m. 

3. CERTIFICATION 

I, Steven Boone, City Clerk of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, certify the above is a true and 
correct synopsis of the discussion from the work session of the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, 
Alabama held at City Hall, Pre-Council Room (A 106) on November 12,20 19, and that the meeting was duly 
called and held in all respects in accordance with the laws of the State of Alabama and bylaws of the City and 
that no formal action or votes were conducted at said work session. 

City Clerk 
Approved by City Council November 25,20 19 

November 1 2,20 19 



.-. . 
Sam Gaston 

IUke womac* 
WedMay, 0 ~ 3 0 , 2 0 1 9  1::4: AM 
VIRGINIAC SMITH: PhOip Blasl: LWMsltm: S l m  Wekh III: Sam Curtm: B l y  
PAcham 

Suq& M F+ Naanber 1 a1 9:a. HHrmsumd W Hall- IntsrCiPI Racyshp C h a m  

Letting you all know lhir is happing on Friday. Can w pleaseadd to the Nov 12 agenda? 

To: Kimberly Cook Qrw@vM.og>. Alier Womack ~licntomack14~maiIIeom>. B"n 
Thamcl Cblhmssl@gnail.mnu. Andy Gwollncy ~ndy@sndygwaltey.c~rnrn, Carcy 
Middldomalrr u a w v r n i d d i ~ b m o ~ ~ r a l ~ b m ~ ~ o Y ) .  l r d o  Andnu - - .  
ahk@t+~bell . . . ;h~o~&.~~ 
Snbje& Fdd.yNmmbm 1 a l 9 ~ , H o m m o r d  City Hall- Imlrr-City Recycling CbaIkr~ge 

Onober 30,2019 

For 1mmrdi.Ieblrlrur: IntrFClty Recyrli~tg Challenge ir ON1 

IoioCiry Covnrilon horn Hmwr, Mountain Bmok, Vaavi. H i L  and Homovood on W h y  
memlmk N w u k  I .I 9:M. at H o m n w d  City Hsll m kick aRow InlcrCity Recycling 
Challryc. Wc will bc j o i d  by mp-nmiws fmm Binninghm Rceyrling nnd R c c o v q  

Details of our InterGiV Recycling Challenge: 

D u r a h  : 6 monlhs. b i n n i n g  November 1.2018 

Terms : Ths Cby with thegraatast reduction in mntamlnation ole5 wins 

Prire.: The particlptlng mundlom from the losing dUea will each contribute an amounl 
oftheir chmslng to a charityofthewhning city+= ohwslng 

Bash : BirminghamRecfding and Remverywill pmvide a Bmonth a w g e  base 
(5tading) rate 

Judging : Birmingham Recyding and Recovery will report the winner ofthe mmpetitiin 

Marc: Cmmcilors fmm Mountain Rmnk. Vcstavio Hills. Hamewcad. and Hoover are beginning 
an educaional a w n m  campaign hat will hoip increarte ruccessrul noyelingpnicipaion. 
while dcchearing mnminm~ion. The idcn is to chnllcnge our mpcctive municipalities by having 
G lfie~~dlycomplilian: which Cily enn Ion.ar lhcir nvcragc conmminulian rate by lhc 
n m t n t  nerrmmuc? The ~ i n n i n r  City will ehnn.e a non-pronofit. to whish the losing Councilors 

We also welmmeand ehallengc any other rnunieipiity in lhc hegigion. We will publishour data 
monthly, alonywiha simple infographic wilh n lip an lhc do's and don's ofrreycling. 

Thr reryelingirnlustry ination-wide is cxpericnuiny dei.\,aiiatin& Insser. The dcnmnd for its 
pnduet ircxlncmcly low. lhunln lo n nenreli~ni~vulion nfli?e Cilinesu morkel. nud thusupply is 
cstremncly mnlminoled. due lo eonfurion on \vhm irnnd isn'ttleceplnbiv to place in recycling 
hima. A d  our govcmmenls are hcingchagvd Cir lhal conlumim~lio,. ~shieh ovmpcr \vcli 
;thu\.u 3W.. 

ll!nl ~neaur no ~mnllcr hou p r x  our inlcotiu.\,urc nlun \re rr-?)rlc. u,lllaln.ndl..,n u.!ol nil l4n 
;,ltiw lr.t;L Ikud A* n rcunn. nd ha$cin co,8ln,l "a rs,?aami~u#,~si cl:.. to.n".,*c .o.%: ~ ~ ~ l r c l l c  111' 

p.,d rc;)c~:ni? ~pmJ.tr~r ilnd c~ I 0 . 8 8  prur.e*~~>. enrlr 

I s  impru\c llw q i n n ' r  mcycliny cnbm. ad lhc value our ci l i~fnn mciw lor \\hat IBu) pa! 
rer thiszccvi~~. $+F are strning a ~ i t ~ - h ? ~ i c !  public. uducstinn can~pign on uim! i s  md in)'! 
rxydabl.. 

I'cople \\ant lo do lltc right thiog. t l i l c l  \\r.c:t;m nqsirt. nnd i8qmww ihe wc)ulinp uxpcries~ce iornl 
sui~-?ss rate region-rvidd. 

R,r more inlumr~icm un asr Coujrcilar Kou~,dtohlr. ri$ilnl.cam: 

Jd1.C wdms 
HomnaadWNCovMl 
Wad 6. Fils l 

StarUng month : November 2018 
Ending month : April 2019 





Minute Book 90 

MINUTES OF THE REGULAR OF THE 
CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MOUNTAIN BROOK 

NOVEMBER 12,2019 

The City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama and met in public session in the City Hall 
Council Chamber at approximately 7:00 p.m. on the 12th day of November, 20 19. The Council President 
called the meeting to order and the roll was called with the following results: 

Present: Virginia C. Smith, Council President 
William S. Pritchard 111, Council President Pro Tempore 
Philip E. Black 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 
Stewart Welch 111, Mayor 

Absent: None 

Also present were City Attorney Whit Colvin, City Manager Sam Gaston and City Clerk Steven 
Boone. 

The Council President stated that a quorum was present and that the meeting was open for the 
transaction of business 

1. RECOGNITION OF GUESTS 

Council President Smith recognized Boy Scouts Henry Short representing Troop 53, Robert Martin 
representing Troop 28 and Jackson Short representing Troop 86. 

2. PRESENTATION 

Mayor Welch presented Ms. Lou Mahon, tired educator from Cahaba Heights, with the Retired 
Teachers' Day proclamation (No. 20 19-1 686). 

3. CONSENT AGENDA 

Council President Smith announced that the following matters will be considered at one time on the 
consent agenda provided no one in attendance objects: 

Approval of the minutes of the October 28,2019, regular meeting of the City 
Council 

2019-164 Small Business Saturday proclamation Exhibit 1 

2019-165 Authorize the placement of a street light on an existing utility Exhibit 2, 
pole between 2428-2430 Mountain Brook Circle to illuminate a Appendix 1 
walking path from Mountain Brook Village to Heathermoor 
Road at the Mountain Brook Elementary playing field 

2019-166 Authorize the expenditure of funds for traffic island 
improvements at Brook Manor Drive 

Exhibit 3, 
Appendix 2 

2019-167 Reaffm the City's commitment to promote safe workplace Exhibit 4, 
guidelines with respect to the City's workers' compensation Appendix 3 
program 

20 19-168 Retired Teachers' Day proclamation Exhibit 5 

J:\Minutes & Agendas\Council\20 19D0 191 1 12 Minutesdoc November 12,20 19 



Minute Book 90 

2019-169 Authorize the execution of an amendment, including the stacked Exhibit 6, 
stone bridge railing design modifications and preparation of Appendix 4 
20 19 Rebuild Alabama grant application, to the previously 
authorized professional services agreement (Resolution No. 
20 16-202) between the City and Gresham, Smith and Partners 
with respect the Caldwell Mill Road bridge replacement 

2019-170 Authorize the sale of certain personal property by way of public Exhibit 7 
Internet auction or the disposal of said property not sold 

20 19-171 Authorize the re-establishment of one (1 ) Payroll Specialist Exhibit 8, 
position (Class no. 0101 5, G18) for the Finance Department to Appendix 5 
be filled at the discretion of the City Manager in accordance 
with the "Rules and Regulations" of the Personnel Board of 
Jefferson County 

2019-172 Authorize the creation of one (1) Administrative Assistant Exhibit 9, 
position (Class no. 00066, G16) for the Finance Department to Appendix 6 
be filled at the discretion of the City Manager in accordance 
with the "Rules and Regulations" of the Personnel Board of 
Jefferson County 

2019-173 Reappoint Susan Elliott to The Emmet O'Neal Library Board, Exhibit 10, 
to serve without compensation, her term to end November 12, Appendix 7 
2023 

2019-174 Reappoint John R. Doody Jr. to the Finance Committee, to Exhibit 11 
serve without compensation, with the term of office to end 
November 23,2023 

2019-175 Authorize the City Manager to issue and execute, for and on Exhibit 12, 
behalf of the City, a purchase order in the amount of $45,022.59 Appendix 8 
for the acquisition and installation of play equipment at 
Canterbury Park 

Thereupon, the foregoing minutes, proclamations and resolutions were introduced by Council 
President Smith and a motion for their immediate adoption made by Council member Shelton. The minutes, 
proclamations and resolutions were then considered by the City Council. Council member Black seconded the 
motion to adopt the foregoing minutes, proclamations and resolutions. Then, upon the question being put and 
the roll called, the vote was recorded as follows: 

Ayes: Virginia C. Smith, Council President 
William S. Pritchard 111, Council President Pro Tempore 
Philip E. Black 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 

Nays: None 

Council President Smith thereupon declared that said minutes, proclamations (No. 20 19- 164 and 
20 1 9- 1 68) and resolutions (Nos. 20 19- 1 65 through 20 1 9- 1 67 and 20 1 9- 169 through 20 1 9-1 75) are adopted by 
a vote of 5-0 and that and as evidence thereof she signed the same. 

November 12,201 9 



Minute Book 90 1205 

4. CONSIDERATION OF AN ORDINANCE (NO. 2061) AMENDING SEC. 303(A) OF THE 
CITY CODE CHANGING THE TIME OF MUNICIPAL COURT FROM 4 P.M. TO 3 P.M. 
(EXHIBIT 13) 

The ordinance was introduced in writing by Council President Smith who then invited comments. 
There being no comments or questions, President Smith called for a motion. Council President Pro Tempore 
Pritchard made a motion that all rules and regulations which, unless suspended, would prevent the immediate 
consideration and adoption of said ordinance be suspended, and that unanimous consent to the immediate 
consideration of said ordinance is given and that the reading of the ordinance at length be waived. The motion 
was seconded by Council member Black. Thereupon, Council President Smith called for vote with the 
following results: 

Ayes: Virginia C. Smith 
William S. Pritchard, I11 
Philip E. Black 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 

Nays: None 

The Council President Smith declared the motion passed by a vote of 5-0. 

After said ordinance had been considered in full by the Council, Council member Black moved for the 
adoption of said ordinance. The motion was seconded by Council member Womack. Thereupon, Council 
President Smith called for vote with the following results: 

Ayes: Virginia C. Smith 
William S. Pritchard, I11 
Philip E. Black 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 

Nays: None 

The Council President Smith declared that the said ordinance (No. 2061) is hereby adopted by a vote of 
5-0 and, as evidence thereof, she signed the same. 

5. PUBLIC HEARING: CONSIDERATION OF AN ORDINANCE (NO. 2062) ADOPTING THE 
2018 BUILDING CODE AND 2017 ELECTRICAL CODE (EXHIBIT 14) 

The ordinance was introduced in writing by Council President Smith who then invited comments. 
There being no comments or questions, President Smith called for a motion. Council member Womack made 
a motion that all rules and regulations which, unless suspended, would prevent the immediate consideration 
and adoption of said ordinance be suspended, and that unanimous consent to the immediate consideration of 
said ordinance is given and that the reading of the ordinance at length be waived. The motion was seconded by 
Council President Pro Tempore Pritchard. Thereupon, Council President Smith called for vote with the 
following results: 

Ayes: Virginia C. Smith 
William S. Pritchard, I11 
Philip E. Black 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 

Nays: None 

The Council President Smith declared the motion passed by a vote of 5-0. 

November 12,20 19 



1206 Minute Book 90 

After said ordinance had been considered in fill by the Council, Council President Pro Tempore 
Pritchard moved for the adoption of said ordinance. The motion was seconded by Council member Black. 
Thereupon, Council President Smith called for vote with the following results: 

Ayes: Virginia C. Smith 
William S. Pritchard, 111 
Philip E. Black 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 

Nays: None 

The Council President Smith declared that the said ordinance (No. 2062) is hereby adopted by a vote of 5-0 
and, as evidence thereof, she signed the same. 

6. ANNOUNCEMENTS 

The next regular meeting of the City Council will be November 25,2019, at 7 9 0  p.m. in the Council 
Chamber of City Hall located at 56 Church Street, Mountain Brook, AL 35213. 

7. ADJOURNMENT 

There being no firther business to come before the City Council, Council President Smith adjourned 
the meeting at approximately 7:30 p.m. 

8. CERTIFICATION 

I, Steven Boone, City Clerk of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, certify the above is a true and 
correct transcript of the regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama held at 
City Hall, Council Chamber (Room A 108) on November 12,20 19, and that the meeting was duly called and 
held in all respects in accordance with the laws of the State of Alabama and bylaws of the City and that a 
quorum was present. 

City Clerk 
Approved by City Council November 25,20 1 9 

EXHIBIT 1 

PROCLAMATION (2019-164) 

Whereas, the government of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, celebrates its local small 
businesses and the contributions they make to its local economy and community; according to the United 
States Small Business Administration, there are currently 30.7 million small businesses in the United States, 
they represent 99.7 percent of all businesses with paid employees in the United States, are responsible for 64.9 
percent of net new jobs created fiom 2000 to 20 18; and 

Whereas, small businesses employ 47.3 percent of the employees in the private sector in the United 
States; and 

Whereas, 94% of consumers in the United States value the contributions small businesses make in 
their community; and 

J:\Minutes & Agendas\Council\20 19\20 19 1 1 12 Minutes.doc November 12,20 19 



Minute Book 90 1207 

Whereas, 96% of consumers who plan to shop on Small Business Saturday@ said the day inspires 
them to go to small, independently-owned retailers or restaurants that they have not been to before, or would 
not have otherwise tried; and 

Whereas, 92% of companies planning promotions on Small Business Saturday said the day helps 
their business stand out during the busy holiday shopping season; and 

Whereas, the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama supports its local businesses that create jobs, boost 
the local economy and preserve communities; and 

Whereas, advocacy groups, public and private organizations across the country have endorsed the 
Saturday after Thanksgiving as Small Business Saturday. 

Now, Therefore, I, Stewart H. Welch 111, Mayor of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama do hereby 
proclaim, November 30,20 19, as: 

"SMALL BUSINESS SATURDAY" 

and urge the residents of our community, and communities across the country, to support small businesses and 
merchants on Small Business Saturday and throughout the year. 

EXHIBIT 2 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-165 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, as follows: 

1. That Alabama Power Company is requested to install one (1) 108 watt LED area, 4000K, 
gray - 8,500 to 14,000 lumens street light on an existing pole in the vicinity of 2428-2430 
Mountain Brook Circle as more fully described in Exhibit A attached hereto (Lighting S e ~ c e s  
NESC Lease Agreement (Governmental-S)). 

2. That the City Manager is hereby authorized to execute and deliver, or cause to be executed 
and delivered, on behalf of the City such documents, instruments, and agreements that may be 
deemed necessary or appropriate with respect to said street light upgrades/installations. 

3. That the City Clerk is directed to furnish the Alabama Power Company a certified copy of 
this resolution. 

APPENDIX 1 

EXHIBIT 3 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-166 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that the City 
Council hereby authorizes City Manager to pay, or cause to be paid for and on behalf of the City, up to 
$1,000.00 for materials and provide City labor and equipment to install beautification improvements at the 
Brook Manor Drove traffic island as illustrated in Exhibit A attached hereto. 

APPENDIX 2 

November 12,2019 



Minute Book 90 

EXHIBIT 4 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-167 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that the City 
Council hereby reaffirms the City's commitment to promote safe workplace guidelines with respect to the 
City's workers' compensation program (Exhibit A attached hereto). 

APPENDIX 3 

EXHIBIT 5 

PROCLAMATION (2019-168) 

Whereas, public education is the foundation of our society and is the most critical element in the 
progress and enlightenment of our state and nation; and 

Whereas, public educators in our educational system have carried the torch of knowledge, opening 
doors to the challenge and excitement of learning for countless youths; and 

Whereas, public educators, because of their deep and abiding love of children, have 
displayed a commitment to their students and dedication to their profession; and 

Whereas, our state's retired public educators have served long careers, laboring throughout their 
tenures to educate our state's school children; and 

Whereas, retired public educators throughout Alabama are deserving of the highest praise and 
recognition our state can bestow for devotion to their profession. 

Now, Therefore, I, Stewart H. Welch 111, Mayor of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama do hereby 
proclaim, November 19,20 19, as: 

"RETIRED TEACHERS' DA Y" 

in the City and encourage all residents to join together in paying tribute to its retired public educators. 

EXHIBIT 6 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-169 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that the City 
Council hereby authorizes either the Mayor or City Manager to execute, for and on behalf of the City, an 
amendment, including the stacked stone bridge railing design modifications and preparation of 201 9 Rebuild 
Alabama grant application (Exhibit A attached hereto), to the previously authorized professional services 
agreement between the City and Gresham, Smith and Partners with respect the Caldwell Mill Road bridge 
replacement. 

APPENDIX 4 

November 12,20 19 



Minute Book 90 

EXHIBIT 7 

RESOLUTION NO, 2019-170 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE SALE OR DISPOSAL 
OF CERTAIN SURPLUS PROPERTY 

WHEREAS, the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, has certain items of personal property which are 
no longer needed for public or municipal purposes; and 

WHEREAS, Section 1 1-43-56 of the Alabama Code of 1975 authorizes the municipal governing 
body to dispose of unneeded personal property. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, as 
follows: 

Section 1. It is hereby established and declared that the following property owned by the City of 
Mountain Brook, Alabama is not needed for public or municipal purposes and is hereby declared surplus 
property: 

Item 
Computer Tower 
Barcode Scanner 
Computer Tower 
Computer Monitor 
Receipt Printer 
Barcode Scanner 
Barcode Scanner 
Cash Register 
Computer Monitor 
Computer Monitor 
Computer Speakers 
Computer Tower 
Computer Tower 
Copier 
Laptop Computer 
Laptop Computer 
Laptop Computer 
Laptop Computer 
Laptop Computer 
Portable Audio System 
Scanner 
Scanner 
Tablet Computer 
Tablet Computer 
Video Camera 

Brand 
Dell 
Metrologic 
Dell 
Dell 
Transact Technologies 
1D 

Sky 
Royal 
3M 
Dell 
Insignia 
Dell 
HP 
Kyocera 
Dell 
Dell 

Apple 
Apple 
Sony 
Anchor 
Avision 
Fuj itsu 

Apple 
Apple 
JVC 

Model 
Optiplex 9020 
MS9540 Voyager 
Optiplex 3020 
P22 14Hb 
iThaca iTherm 280 
Scanner 
Scanner 
alpha7 1 OML 
94 10 Self Check 
P2012Ht 
NA 
Optiplex 790 
rp5700 
TASKAlpha3050 
Inspiron 15-5547 
Inspiron 5755 
Macbook Pro 13" 
Macbook Pro 15" 
Vaio VPCS 1 1 FM 
Liberty LIB-6000C 
AV 186+ 
fi-6 100 
iPad A1 396 
iPad A1459 
3CCD Everio 

Quantity 
11 
4 
4 
2 
2 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 

Section 2. That the City Manager, or his designated representative, is hereby authorized and directed 
to sell said property by way of public Internet auction or to dispose of such property not sold at auction. 

November 12,20 19 



Minute Book 90 

EXHIBIT 8 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-171 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama that the City 
Council hereby authorizes the re-establishment of one (1) Payroll Specialist position (Class no. 01 0 15, G 18) 
for the Finance Department to be filled at the discretion of the City Manager in accordance with the "Rules and 
Regulations" of the Personnel Board of Jefferson County. 

APPENDIX 5 

EXHIBIT 9 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-172 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama that the City 
Council hereby authorizes the creation of one (1) Administrative Assistant position (Class no. 00066, G 1 6) for 
the Finance Department to be filled at the discretion of the City Manager in accordance with the "Rules and 
Regulations" of the Personnel Board of Jefferson County. 

APPENDIX 6 

EXHIBIT 10 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-173 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that Susan Elliott 
is hereby appointed to The Emmet O'Neal Library Board, to serve without compensation, her term to end 
November 12,2023. 

APPENDIX 7 

EXHIBIT 11 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-174 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that John R. 
Doody, Jr. is hereby reappointed to the Finance Committee, to serve without compensation, with the tern of 
office to end November 23,2023. 

EXHIBIT 12 

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-175 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that the City 
Council hereby authorizes the City Manager to issue and execute, for and on behalf of the City, a purchase 
order in the amount of $45,022.59 for the acquisition and installation of play equipment at Canterbury Park. 

APPENDIX 8 

November 12,20 19 



Minute Book 90 

EXHIBIT 13 

ORDINANCE NO. 2061 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 30-3(a) OF THE CITY CODE - 
TIME AND PLACE OF HOLDING COURT 

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that Section 30- 
3(a) of the City Code is hereby amended as follows: 

1. "Sec. 30-3. -Time and place of holding court. 
(a) The municipal court of the city shall hold court commencing at . on 

Wednesday of each week, except the fifth Wednesday in each month or a 
week containing a holiday, in the council chamber of city hall and at such 
other times as a municipal judge may continue or set a case. If approved by 
a municipal judge, court may be rescheduled to address an irresolvable conflict, 
an unforeseen circumstance, or inclement weather. 

2. Re~ealer. All ordinances or parts of ordinances heretofore adopted by the City Council of the City 
of Mountain Brook, Alabama that are inconsistent with the provisions of this ordinance are hereby expressly 
repealed. 

3. Severabilih.. If any part, section or subdivision of this ordmance shall be held unconstitutional or 
invalid for any reason, such holding shall not be construed to invalidate or impair the remainder of this 
ordinance, which shall continue in full force and effect notwithstanding such holding. 

4. Effective Date. This ordinance shall become effective the 1" day of January 2020. 

EXHIBIT 14 

ORDINANCE NO. 2062 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING SECTIONS 109-31,109-56,109-195, AND 
109-227 OF THE CITY CODE AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE 2018 VERSIONS 

OF SPECIFIED BUILDING AND TECHNICAL CODES AND THE 2017 VERSION OF THE 
ELECTRICAL CODE 

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama (the "City Council") 
heretofore has adopted various technical codes promulgated by the International Code Council (the "ICC") and 
the National Fire Protection Association relating to buildings, residences and other structures in the City of 
Mountain Brook (the "City"), and operations in the City concerning fuel gas, mechanical, plumbing, and 
electrical systems (collectively, the "Technical Codes"); 

WHEREAS, the City Council desires that, except to the extent specified herein, the City adopt, the 
2018 versions of the Building and Technical Codes except for the electrical code which is the 2017 version 
(the "Updated Building and Technical Codes") that are specified herein for use and application for buildings 
and structures within its corporate limits; 

WHEREAS, the adoption of the Updated Building and Technical Codes by reference is authorized by 
9 11-45-8 Code of Alabama (1 975); and 

WHEREAS, the adoption of the Updated Building and Technical Codes will facilitate the 
performance of inspection activities by the City, and promote the public safety, health and general welfare of 
its citizens and owners, occupants and users of buildings and structures in the City. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City as follows: 



1212 Minute Book 90 

Section 1. Section 109-3 1 of the City Code is hereby repealed and replaced with the following: 

"Sec. 109-31. - Building codes-Adoption by reference. 

(a) Except as provided herein, the International Buildinn Code - 201 8 Edition ("ICC Building Code") and 
International Residential Code - 201 8 Edition (the "IRC") and International Swimming Pool and Spa 
Code - 201 8 Edition (the "ISPSC"), as published by the ICC and available for purchase at 900 
Montclair Road, Birmingham, Alabama, are hereby adopted as the building code of the city by reference 
as though they were set forth fully herein. 

(b) The building codes adopted by Section 109-3 1 (a) are amended as follows: 

(i) The following codes that are referenced in this Section [A] 10 1.4 of the ICC Building Code are 
not adopted: (a) the International Property Maintenance Code referenced in Section 101.4.4; 
and (b) the International Existing Building Code referenced in Section 10 1.4.7. 

(ii) Section [A] 109.2 of ICC Building Code & Section R108.2 of IRC are hereby repealed and are 
replaced in their entirety with the following: 

Schedule of Permit Fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing 
systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee or fees as set forth in City Code Section 14-1 
shall be paid at the time of filing application, in accordance with such fee schedule as shall be 
set fiom time to time by the city council. A list of such fees shall be kept on file in the city 
clerk's office. 

(iii) Sections [A] 1 1 1.1 of ICC Building Code & R1lO.l of IRC are hereby repealed and are 
replaced in their entirety with the following: 

Use and occupancy. No residential building or structure shall be used or occupied, and no 
change in the existing occupancy classification of a residential building or structure or portion 
thereof shall be made until the building official has issued a certificate of occupancy which has 
been signed by the building official and the City Manager. No commercial building or structure 
shall be used or occupied, and no change in the existing occupancy classification of a 
commercial building or structure or portion thereof shall be made until the building official has 
issued a certificate of occupancy which has been signed by the building official, the fire official, 
and the City Manager. A certificate of occupancy shall not be issued until after the City 
Manager shall have determined that the building conforms to all provisions and regulations of 
the city with respect thereto, including its use under the zoning ordinances of the city. A 
certificate of occupancy (whether a temporary certificate of the regular certificate) issued 
without the signature or the building official, fire official (in the case of commercial buildings), 
and the City Manager shall not be deemed to be a certificate of occupancy issued under this 
code or under the city's zoning ordinance. 

(iv) Sections [A] 1 13 of ICC Building Code & R112 of the IRC are hereby repealed and are 
replaced in their entirety with the following: 

Appeals regarding the application of the adopted building codes may be presented to the City 
Manager for consideration. The City Manager may elect to render a decision on such appeal or 
remand the appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. In cases where the appeal is heard by the 
City Manager and a decision is rendered, the appellant, if not satisfied with the decision, may 
then appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. 

The board of zoning adjustment of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, as said board is 
prescribed by Section 1 1-52-80 Code of Alabama (1975), as amended, shall constitute a board 
of adjustments and appeals under these codes. 

November 12,20 19 



Minute Book 90 1213 

(v) Sections [A] 1 14.4 of ICC Building Code & R113.4 of IRC are hereby repealed and are replaced 
in their entirety with the following: 

R113.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who violates a provision of these codes or fails to 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 
building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the 
building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of these codes, shall be 
subject to penalties as prescribed by law. 

In instances where a person commences work prior to making application for a required permit, 
all applicable permit fees shall be doubled. Once notified in writing by the building official of 
the City that a report or building permit application must be submitted, such person must submit 
such report within ten (10) days. Persons who fail to make such report within the time period 
required shall be subject to additional penalties as provided under Sec. 1-6.1 of the City Code 
and by $13A-10-4 of the Code of Alabama. 

(vi) Chapter 11 of IRC is adopted except as follows: (a) notwithstanding any provisions contained in 
Chapter 1 1 or elsewhere in the IRC, the Energy Efficiency requirements in the IRC shall not be 
applicable to the repair, renovation, alteration or reconstruction of existing buildings and 
structures; and (b) the minimum standards for insulation to be used in connection with the 
repair, renovation, alteration or reconstruction of existing buildings and structures shall not be 
less than R-30 for ceiling spaces, R-13 for walls and R-19 for floors. 

(vii) Section P2904 of the IRC- Dwelling Unit Fire Sprinkler Systems is adopted, but amended by 
adding the following provision as P2904.8.9: 

P2904.8.9 Residential Sprinkler Exemption. Notwithstanding any provision in this Section 
P2904 or elsewhere in the IRC, any homeowner, upon application to the City's building official, 
may request an exemption to the sprinkler system requirements of P2904.1 for a dwelling and 
such exemption shall be granted upon satisfaction of each of the following: 

a. The applicant must either confer with the City Fire Marshal or his or her designee about the 
benefits of installing a residential fire sprinkler system or review presentation materials 
developed by the Fire Marshal concerning sprinkler systems; 

b. The applicant must certify that he or she has met the requirements in subsection (a) above, 
and fully understands and acknowledges the risks of opting not to install a residential fire 
sprinkler system; 

Exceptions: 

i. No exemption shall be granted for any dwelling constructed less than 5 feet from the property 
line; and 

ii. No exemption shall be granted for 2-family or more dwelling units. 
(viii) Section 506.2.1 of the 201 8 IRC is adopted but is amended by adding the following language to 

such section: 

Fill depths between 24-60" shall be permitted where fill consists of #57 compacted gravel stone 
backfill and where #4 rebar on 16" center tied in both directions or other approved 
reinforcement material, as specified by an engineer's report, is utilized." 

Section 2. Section 109-56 of the City Code is repealed and replaced with the following: 

November 12,2019 



1214 Minute Book 90 

"Sec. 109-56. - Electrical code-Adopted by reference. 

The National Electrical Code. 20 17 Edition, published by the National Fire Protection Association and 
available for purchase from the National Fire Protection Association, 1 Batterymarch Park, Quincy, MA, is 
hereby adopted by reference as though it were set forth fully herein as the electrical code of the city." 

Section 3. Section 109-1 95 of the City Code is repealed and replaced with the following: 

"Sec. 109-195. - Gas and mechanical codes-Adoption by reference. 

(a) Except as provided herein, the International Fuel Gas Code - 201 8 Edition (the "Gas Code") and 
International Mechanical Code - 201 8 Edition (the "Mechanical Code"), both published by International 
Code Council ("ICC") and available for purchase at 900 Montclair Road, Birmingham, Alabama, are 
hereby adopted as the gas and mechanical code of the city by reference as though they were set forth 
fully herein. 

(b) The Gas Code and the Mechanical Code, adopted by Section 109-195 are amended as follows: 

(i) Sections [A] 106.6.2 of Gas Code & [A] 106.5.2 of Mechanical Code are hereby repealed and are 
replaced in their entirety with the following: 
Schedule of Permit Fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing ' 
systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee or fees as set forth in City Code Section 14-1 shall 
be paid at the time of filing application, in accordance with such fee schedule as shall be set from 
time to time by the city council. A list of such fees shall be kept on file in the city clerk's office. 

(ii) Sections [A] 108.4 of Gas Code & Mechanical Codes are hereby repealed and are replaced in 
their entirety with the following: 

[A] 108.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who violates a provision of these codes or fails to 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building 
or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the building 
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to 
penalties as prescribed by law. 

In instances where a person commences work prior to making application for a required permit, 
all applicable permit fees shall be doubled. Once notified in writing by the building official of the 
City that a report or building permit application must be submitted, such person must submit such 
report within ten (10) days. Persons who fail to make such report within the time period required 
shall be subject to additional penalties as provided under Sec. 1-6.1 of the city code and by § 13A- 
10-4 of the Code of Alabama. 

(iii) Sections 109 of Gas Code & Mechanical Code are hereby repealed and are replaced in their 
entirety with the following: 

Appeals regarding the application of the adopted building codes may be presented to the City 
Manager for consideration. The City Manager may elect to render a decision on such appeal or 
remand the appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. In cases where the appeal is heard by the 
City Manager and a decision is rendered, the appellant, if not satisfied with the decision, may then 
appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. 

The Board of Zoning Adjustment of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, as said board is 
prescribed by Section 1 1-52-80 Code of Alabarna (1 973, as amended, shall constitute a board of 
adjustments and appeals under these codes." 

Section 4. Section 109-227 of the City Code is repealed and replaced with the following: 

November 12,2019 



Minute Book 90 1215 

"Sec. 109-227. Plumbing Code-Adoption by reference. 

(a) Except as provided herein, the International Plumbing Code - 20 18 Edition published by International 
Code Council ("ICC") (the "Plumbing Code") and available for purchase at 900 Montclair Road, 
Birmingham, Alabama, is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of the city by reference as though it 
were fully set forth herein. 

(b) The Plumbing Code adopted by Section 10-227(a) is amended as follows: 

(i) Section [A] 106.6.2 of Plumbing Code - Fee Schedule. This Section is not adopted in the form 
proposed by the ICC, and is replaced in its entirety with the following: 

Schedule of Permit Fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing 
systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee or fees as set forth in City Code Section 14-1 shall 
be paid at the time of filing application, in accordance with such fee schedule as shall be set from 
time to time by the city council. A list of such fees shall be kept on file in the city clerk's office. 

(ii) Section [A] 108.4 of Plumbing Code is hereby repealed and is replaced in its entirety with the 
following: 

[A] 108.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building 
or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the building 
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to 
penalties as prescribed by law. 

In instances where a person commences work prior to making application for a required permit, 
all applicable permit fees shall be doubled. Once notified in writing by the building official of the 
City that a report or building permit application must be submitted, such person must submit such 
report within ten (10) days. Persons who fail to make such report within the time period required 
shall be subject to additional penalties as provided under Sec. 1-6.1 of the City Code and by 
$1 3A-10-4 of the Code of Alabama. 

(iii) Section 109 of Plumbing Code is hereby repealed and is replaced in its entirety with the 
following: 

Appeals regarding the application of the adopted building code may be presented to the city 
manager for consideration. The City Manager may elect to render a decision on such appeal or 
remand the appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. In cases where the appeal is heard by the 
City Manager and a decision is rendered, the appellant, if not satisfied with the decision, may then 
appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. 

The board of zoning adjustment of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, as said board is 
prescribed by Section 11-52-80 Code of Alabama (1 975), as amended, shall constitute a board of 
adjustments and appeals under this code. 

(iv) Section 4 10.3 of the Plumbing Code is amended to add the following as Subpart "3" under 
Exceptions: 

3. An approved water cooler with an accessible approved spout height and a bottled water 
dispenser and permanent affixed cup or water bottle holder shall be permitted to be 
substituted for a standard high low water cooler furture complying with 410 in instances 
where the space is shown to be limited. Such substitution shall only be permitted where the 
update is part of renovation of an existing group B or M business space. 

Section 5. This ordinance is cumulative in nature and is in addition to any power and authority which 
the City of Mountain Brook may have under any other ordinance or law. 

J:\Minutes & Agendas\Council\20 19\20 19 1 1 12 Minutesdoc November 12,20 19 



1216 Minute Book 90 

Section 6. If any part, section or subdivision of this ordinance shall be held unconstitutional or invalid 
for any reason, such holding shall not be construed to invalidate or impair the remainder of this ordinance, 
which shall continue in full force and effect, notwithstanding such holding. 

Section 7. Any provisions herein that the City has adopted that deviate from the Technical Codes that 
are adopted by reference shall prevail over any conflicting provision of those Technical Codes. All other 
ordinances or parts of ordinances heretofore adopted by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, 
Alabama, which are inconsistent with the provisions of this ordinance, are hereby expressly repealed. 

In addition, when a provision in the adopted Technical Codes or this Ordinance refers to the duties of 
certain named officials, the official of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama whose duties most closely 
correspond to those of such named official shall be deemed the official responsible for the enforcement of said 
provision. 

Section 8. The effective date of this Ordinance shall be January 1,2020. 

November 12,20 19 



- 

Minute 

Whhylmnh ME- L.u.Agrnn.l(~or.-mUI) POWER 
."."".."m 

-L.px-- PwmTWw --"- 1- - PO 8 0 1 1 Y 0 0 0 . 8 m A L U l t l  
"y:Uan- ...-- P n  

7 - 0  wr-- 

a "W 0 "so w;=&y&g.--- "-0 *p, are- --.. 

'"-9.-1-.1-1.11."-*I*I-D--. 
* L L . . . - U O - I . . . P " I - " * . - # C I C I C I C I C I C I  

- 4 1 4 1 e -  . - - ?='wA.b 1 --- -.a, -- 

L . 
s""- - h M  
Il 
m =--&2SE- zz- w--Yuh..*- 

YLr*kUW)lbmrlDM~ 

h 
I h b . Y 4 P - m - - W - M . . ~ " . - * - I D d  
-mWsWc4&mcddUlhnrr* .dLL. Ik  . q p * L . . . h . . 1 1 . D -  
WHCD-I)Yanll---dW 
-.-.I(II*w"LF4."dbMMtk*I.11-tk- 

R- 

PI- 

a"dYuM.=+L 

YhudSm.3 

PO_.-- - -,,.- 
DPIIIDMIB- 

001-R 

-urp 
RIYI-- 
*L-,OD*ru2MU7IY 
mR- 
- - m M W -  

- 
U YU* 

I 
:3ook 90 1217 

-."-IIIIC- 

--.------ ' m"--"**"-'-l"-.-.~-"'"~--. -z%--=.%az~-==--b--=:z.c?- 

. 
I-- ..--...-.--.-p- C ' 

~ ~ ~ ~ & & ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ m ~ & 7 ~ ~ ~ - - - ~ ~ =  

-2.. 



Minute 

TmRic itlard Policy Wotkshm 

November 12,2019 



November 12.2019 



Minute 



Minute 

Wb boI VVOI~WI tnrr lrwl #r J u r q  ca&Qrrcfu apolll  rnrrl *!Ax Uns program to Ihu fdl(mlrgfcJym 
r l h ~ C # ~ j s p w  dongwng efbts ta UUIS lha need; of thoCtlfa bridges md budgel fundafw Ihr 

rc,amrw( and ~ ~ ~ U ( I L W I M ~ ~ ~ Y . U  Clty b r ~ m  ~ndrd~np:hs C D M I I  U IIRan brag: - T k - r c m  'w 111 . ..rq I cu' Q?e%iy~#-movtrxmQ~Qtn IwcnWm vwcrrran 4 1-2 io- yxs rarw * f 

the ant- be*. Tk.  nittag br.+ n .ho J bpdnuhc'chok mm'h Ltnh Shd.r Cntk  - Tle Crtfs m ; l ~ n g ~ l s  IoponJc &ion.I C q  tw& LOuae-Uh t h e ~ u U  tun41 locomcJur lha LW 
unk!  trhu r l ,qrr  *.?*naH,q mcwm nirnrnrnnrvrtw 

Saw: R W M  UYum ASS &nu* Grant -8m 

Cldp.Ro(llumn(m~HUI~Olruul8-Cmh 

~~U 
GmmmslmnRgaccm424wm 

(;rcshom 
Smith 

Rebuild Alabama Act Annual GI& Program 
I 
i 

Fiscal Year 2020 Progri~jn Guid&.es i 

' h i s  mntsinr hfbmation @g tho RcW AlaW Act W) W OlPm 
hmmforF&YcdFY)ZU20. ' I b e R A A A M u r l G m t P m m m i s ~ d b y t h c ~  

A rporwring govcmmmlal agmcy ma). only submit one projcd r+pplidm per *& cysle. 
EschCormtysndM\midpnUywiI lkv%medumladi~~.  AnyprojcUarbmiacdby 
m d d f l c r p o m r b d l b ~ u t b e d i g W a ~ f o r d ~  

Othcrhndhg rourf~~  m supplement R A A M  Clrrnl Pmgm fundr sm not mpircd,.but pmjcetc 
codr iq  r commttmtDt to provtcb n t p p l c m d  bidkg nuy be givca t d I c  eoaudurti~n Any political subdivision of tho St& of A h b a a  (Municipal aad County O o v e ~ t r )  ir aligiblo 

toapply f o r l k l d i n g u n d a b R M ~ a i a n t ~  
D. PROIECT PROGRESS: 

R M A n m r a l ~ ~ ~ s m o n i l . b b t o ~ a p D c i e r t o s r p c r i o d o f o r v ( 1 ) ~  
6 a m t h s m t k e o f d  F ~ r d m a r p a r r ~ o r i u g o e c o y o o ( d k 1 u t o ~ m a  
pu&m order i d  agatacl a valid, cligtblc ipplica bid coDtract witND om p a r  olthc d m  of 
awud aro subjazt to &xion. 

Tbo fhl eligibility of ~ppUadwr and propoltd project wtivitirr will bc daamincd by ALDOT 
upon cvrludon of tlm lppliutfon mbdttcd 

E. -0US PROVISIONS: 

Profcetcm~belatowm~~btbkr-plrcabldr~~b~1izsduI~~1~Md,waa 
a d d  following dl required compcfitiw bid laws f a  digi'b*y taddug tkc RAA. No ctbm 
mulWd~fccnmuataa,nrb~fmcc~h.Ilowob 

~ ~ a m v l ~ ~ r w P d e d n t n d r w t t l b c W m t b c ~ w d ~ ( 1 ) v p o n  
~~)01*rrcctiprafrNotlcod~wudhthorpomor$g~~~~..or~)~ 
ALDOT'r receipt of  r Prtrctnto Orda (PO) 60m the ~ p o m a m ~  WW h d  lslmrr vdid, 
w - w -  



Rehuild A1rb.m. Art Annual Gnnt  Pmgrsln Applicntion 
Fiscai Ymr202O 

Minute 

Rebulld Alabama Act (MA) Annual G m t  Prognm 

FREQUENTLY ASKED QUESTIONS 



Minute 
-Fa 

Book 90 

November 12.2019 



1w 
Jab Desnig$2& : The Personnel Board o f  Jefferson County A l m t e  ~~~k 90 

, - .  - 
Payroll Specialist 7-0 ( 7 17aL Nu, 01015 Grade: 

Summary: 
Under general SUpeNlslon, thls position performs complex and speclallzed work related to the preparation, pmcesslng, and 
maintenance of a jurlsdlctlon's payroll, lndudlng the enby of employee-related data Into a mainframe or other InformaUon system 
necessary for malntalnlng accurate payroll/personnel records and for repomng to lnternal and external constltuendes. Thls 
ClaESIflCaUOn has sole responslblllty for accurately pmcesslng all payroll data where a vendor or other Ilalson Is not utilized. 

Typlcal Job Duties 
Malntalns and processes documents related to employees' pay, benerits and compensated leave. 
Malntalns and processes documents related to employees' penslon. 
Ensures the aPPmPrlate amount of funds hr taxes, benetlt payments and other expenses are deducted fmm employees' paycheck 
and sent!? p e  appmpflate redplents,;,., 

:. ..h I;, .:..,-i;Pmres, u~g~3;bn#:m~l~~in~er&nlfai;ddb~&r.r.b~nafin&l records forthe jurlsdlaion, su&bsPersbn,jep~o;lg ( p q  a& : . .  ,.,! K::. 

.aerfannance evalustlanr. - ................... - ..... 
Provides lnformatlon about the jurlsdlction's personnel polldes, program, beneflts and employees to Internal and ektemal entitles 

, :  . .  . . .  
B,"#~~%EU?m%e ",: k ? # ~ a . " $ ~ ~ ~ ~ $ ~ v l d l n g  Important lnfonnatlon about pay indJi;kbeflts to theniw employe& . . 
And asslstlng them wlth the completion of Mrious p a h r k . .  
MFB6IaFd submits reports to appropriate organlzatlons (IRS, State of Alabama) to comply wlth employment regulations. 

. >  I , 

Mathematlcal R StatlstlCal sktlls. 
Oral~.€e(?.wr(!!@on Comprehension. 

Mlnlmum Quollflcations 
The followlng s m n  provides the mlnlmum quallflcatlons necessary for appointment to this job. Appilcants must meet or exceed 
the? quallflcauons In Order to be considered ellglble for employment mnslderation. 
. . .: . . . .  

Eiperlence pmix5sirig an ~rga'nl~t lon's payroll uslng a Payroll or Human Resources information System (e.g. Abm, QulckBwks. cecldlanj::i .,;- :. . , ..# .. 

~ e n ~ e ~ l c u l a t l n g  and ruMlmlng Wages and taxes forwmpletlng taw repore for Federal,State, and County governments (e.g. 
.. - . . . . . . . . .  941, W-Z'A3, &te-wlthholdlng, SUI). : 

Experfence-lnterpretlng deductlo@,codes.and tax codes (e.g., lnterpretatlon of employees FICA, Section 125, Flexlble Spending, 
penslon acmunb, elc;). 
Experience reviewing i calculating time and attendance amrdlng to wage and hour laws (e.g. Fair Labor Standards Act). 
Experfence using common omce software (e.g., spreadsheets to lndude development of formulas, word processing documents). 

PREFERRED 4UAUhCATIONS: 
CeMRed Governmental ~cc'ounting Technlclan. 
Com~leted Davmll semlnars and courses for u ~ d a k d  knowledoe on DaMoll laws and reaulatlons le.a. Fred Prvor Courses). 
~xperienceusing budgeung in regards to p a y h  and mnpe binefltS'(e;g. FICA, health imrance; 111;. ~nsuranie). 
Expcrlence malntalnlng and adrnlnlsterlng payroll docvmenb far an orgardzatlon'r employees Including 1-9 and Federal and State 
wlmholdlng lax forms. 
ExperlenCe remndllng payroll llabllltles and general ledger accounts. 

D~~CIAIMER; Thls job ddacrlption Is not  meant t o  be an all-Inclusive lid of the job duties, responslbllltlea, or skill. and 
abllltlesmqulrad t o  do the jbb and may be changed at the dlscratlon of the Personnel Board a t  any time. 
Camasnmbla Faemrs ..................... 
The followlng section provldes the cornpensable factors for thls job. There factors d u d b e  the experience andlor educauonal Id 
typically possessed by mcumbenk withln thls fob and are used to asskt In detwnlnlng the pay grade forthe job and ellglblllW for 
cewln Ormlum usv. These fanas are not necessarllv reavlrements for emulownt  

, .  . . Hlgh school nlpldma 0rG.E.D. and three years of expirlerice preparing andbrdcesslng payrolls. 
survey Year8 
2019 - 2020 

1111212019, 11:28 AM 

November 12,2019 



Job Descriptip : The Personnel Board o f  Jefferson County A I m t e  B~~~ . 

aass ntle: 
16 

I Print 1 ,.. - 

Clan Number: 00066 Grade: 

Summary: 
Dellvers a wlde variety of non-mutlne admlnlstraUw and support sewicer requiring Independent Judgment and knowledge of detalkd 
operations. Composes correspondence, prepares speclal reports and conducts reseamh. May serve as the lnltlal mntact for 
SUpeNlSors and lead a small gmup of employees. Uses a computer to create modelately complex to complex databases, graphs, 
reports and spreadsheek. 

J,:5 p,.~.~':,.: !,: . , . . , .. l!:.r!? vi !c\l~$,i$an C~vnty  ,A;: ? . m e  - 'Tvpical Job ~ u t i i i  
~ k e t s  vlsltors and callers, responds to thelr lnqulrles, and dlrectr them to the appropriate location. 
Communlcates/collaborates wlth others (In person. over the ohone. mealnos. tralnlnal to obtaln or convev information. - -. 
Schedules/cool~tes events (e.g., meetings, appointments, travel, Uma-sensitive events) and prepares meeting spaces. 
Procweg fonns, records, licenses, slldes and/or other Information to provide servlces and resources. 
Mainelns pap& and electmnlc Rllng systems for records (rnedlcal, clerical, etc.), correspondent&;'and/or other material. 
Receives, sorts, distributes, posts, tracks and malls reports, documents. notfces. slldes and/or other InformaUon. 
COmpOSeS documents by typlng, transcribing, writlng, or mmplllng Informauon and edlts documents for accuracy and completeness. 
Inputs, monlmn, and analyzes dam contained In tables, chats, maps and/or databaxs. . c ~6 cwt 
ilandles PaYments, bllllng, andlor cash by calculaung, mllectlng, pomng, and/or balancing flnanclal Information. 
RaVle,WS flnanclal records for arlthmetlc and clerlcal accuracy and mnformlty to ~ l e s ,  regulations, and laws. 
F'mienespayrpll dedvctlow and deposl@.a.nd.maoagp r@t lncreafe,rewrds. . , .  . , .  ... b:x~ic2,: or ic....r:c' 
b n a p e s a n ~ o r a s ~ l n v a t w v o f  mateflab, 8qqulment.andsupplier. . ,,,... . ,. :: +; *. ,?I:,=. m,-t~=!h~. . . . . . . .  ... . ~ .~ ~ . ~ . . -  
. . . . .  . t  ... 3:. L :: . . . . . . . .  !-, .c.,~~,,; < !:?: , , ~ ,  . ,:,d:t :~ a , , . ,  . ~ 6 . .  -x!v'v .,.,~n?..,x e; c:c s~lc,: c:-.-?ba%s, :i: *>> - 

COMPETENGESI ~o!mtLetmsies are h l n p  developed. 

.,.i. ;.,-. - Mlnlmum Qualllications 
! . . >$.a q e  follo$Jljj ~Mon provldesthe mlnlmum q u a l l r i t s t i i " s e a  hr appointment to thls Job. ~ipl1c;inb must meet orexceed 

these quali@Uons Jn order to be con~~,~lglble.hrI :amployment wnslderation. 
~es i i ~ema loyee  (I:?., not pmb=Uonarv).l!ge . . ~ e r ~ ; w n e ~  ~oard, of Jefferson county ( P W ~  Merit system on or ~efore 
Lannouncement%l~edatel. . 
k lea* on6 Year Of'eXpeHeIKe on or be fo~ f~nno~n&ment  dose date] In one of the followlng da%es: Admlnlsbative Clerk, Medlcal 
aeY, euurtaerk, Office ~srlrtdnt, Ugal sectme, Me'dical secretary, Medlcal Records Clerk; w u n t i n g  Aaistant I, or Acmuntlng . .  .. . .  ,. . .;.: ./ :. c. ., , . AsslitantlI. ' ' , . . .  . . ,  < ' .  

Cumntiy employed In one of the followlng classes: Admlnldratlve Uerk, Medical Clerk. Court Clerk, Office Aaistant, Legal Saretaw 
Medlcsl Secretary, Medlcal Rewrds Clerk, Accounting Amstant I, or Accounting Assistant 11. 

' : , . , , . .  , . . . . . .  ; .'&~.;",*****&>~~..!:. ..... :; $.:. . . . . . . . . . .  ::,. ..; 2:,,1.:>.:,.. 0;;- 'C ."llc,: 

PREFERRED QUAURCATIONS; i:; cjIr:.,,~~*. g, i ~ ' .  :r : .. :G .! ...* . ' .;: . - 
~ ~ h : , ~ l E d u c a t i o n .  . , . r . e - , :  I! a,.p.. , . . , ;  ,. .,. I , <, .. ! .. 
sqmeco l l ' q~  . , . . . .  . . . . . . .  ; , , . . .  4 7.. . . .  & >  ; ................... . :  - , ,  8 ;  . , .- - 3  - -.:.s.;;! 
SereRlyearspLexp~en- in bidmlnp.ve.: . , -..., .c. .;, . -..;A ci .%, ....... .$ :... irur :: ...7,c ,. ,, 
Advanced a;perience uslng desktop comp~i?er~soRwaf&: .:,-;.:, ..s. ........ . . . . . . . . . . .  : ..............~ !,.:r c.. . 

: 7 . .  ..: .. . , . ,  . . .. ., ; I : ;  ?,. :. 4 ,  ?., .;r,nrw.. 

DISCLAIMER: This Job description lo not meant t o  be an all-Inclusive IIR of  the Job duties, responsibilities, or skllls and . abilltles required to do the Job and m y  be changed at the dkaet ion  of the Parsonnsl Board a t  any Hme. 
Compensable Factors 
The following d o n  pmvldes the campensable l a m  for thls Jab. These lacton dewrlbe the expedence and/or educational level 
typically possessed by incumbents wlthln thls Job and are wed to asslst In determlnlng the pay grade for the job and ellglblllty for 
certdln premium pay. These factors are not necessarily requirements for employment 
Hlgh School Diploma or G.E.D. and three years of responslble clerical experience wlth two yean of a t  the Admlnisbative Uerk level. 
S u w y  Year: . . . .- .. 
2019 - 2020 

. , ~. . .,. 

ll/lU2019, 11:35 AM 
. . 

November 12,2019 



Minute Book 90 
u l y  01 mounwn rrrooK Mall- susan ~IIIOII re.appornreo lo ~ ~ o i a r y  uoam 

Steve Boone cboones@rntnbrook.org> 

Susan Elliott re-appointed to Library Board 
1 message 
. ~ .~ ~- ~. ~ ~ ~ .. ~~ 

Lindsy Gardner clgardner@eolib.org> Tue, Ocl15, 2019 at 9:04 AM 
To: Steve Boone cboones@rntnbrook.org> 

Steve, 
Susan Elliott is willing to serve another term. When appropriate, please add to the City Council agenda for 
approval. 

Thanks, 
Lindsy 

, ., 
tinbsy &rdner, Director 

iEm.tvet.O'Neal Library , . . 

4' 500ak Street . 
Mountain Brook, AL 35213 
205.445.1192 
334.216.9464 cell 
Igarolner@eolib.org 

~ I ~ ~ . . N ~ S U  n ~ n l m  ~mlmsl~~,,~n?i~lnisa7?r~.~r.r..,.~ta.~.,~h..~~a~~~thrnntkkkk~f~7diCd7dfinlda7R7(L(11?~%7rm~~.N~biM7AfiI(ldR7R7 

J:\Minuta & Agendas\Council\2019\2OL91112 Miiutes.doc November 12,2019 





Minute Book 90 

[This page is blank intentionally.] 

November 12,20 19 


