
Minute Book 86 

MOUNTAIN BROOK CITY COUNCIL 
PRE-MEETING DISCUSSION 

JANUARY 12,2015 

The City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama met in public session in the Pre-council 
Room (A 106) of City Hall at 6: 15 p.m. on Monday, the 12th day of January. The Council President called the 
meeting to order and the roll was called with the following results: 

Present: 

Absent: 

Virginia C. Smith, Council President 
William S. Pritchard, 111, Council President Pro Tempore 
Alice B. Womack 
Jack D. Carl 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Lawrence T. Oden, Mayor 

None 

Also present were City Attorney Whit Colvin, City Manager Sam Gaston, and City Clerk Steven 
Boone. 

1. AGENDA 

1. Request by Dowd and Susan Ritter for a waiver of the 2012 International Residential Code for their 
residence under construction at 405 Club Place. (Resolution No. 2015-008 was added to the formal 
agenda.) 

2. Review and discussion of the 7 p.m. City Council formal meeting agenda topics. 

Upon conclusion of the City Council's review of the other formal [7 p.m.] agenda issues, Council 
President Smith adjourned the meeting. 

Steven Boone, City Clerk 

January 12,20 15 



Minute Book 86 

MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE 
CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MOUNTAIN BROOK, ALABAMA 

JANUARY 12,2015 

The City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama met in public session in the City Hall 
Council Chamber at 7:00 p.m. on Monday, the 12th day of January, 2015. The Council President called the 
meeting to order and the roll was called with the following results: 

Present: Virginia C. Smith, Council President 
William S. Pritchard, 111, Council President Pro Tempore 
Alice B. Womack 
Jack D. Carl 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Lawrence T. Oden, Mayor 

Absent: None 

Also present were City Attorney Whit Colvin, City Manager Sam Gaston, and City Clerk Steven 
Boone. 

The City Council President stated that a quorum was present and that the meeting was open for the 
transaction of business. 

1. RECOGNITION OF GUESTS 

Council President Smith recognized several Boy Scouts from Troop 28 in attendance for their 
Communications merit badge. 

2. EXPRESSION OF GRATITUDE TO PATRICK DAVIS FOR HIS SERVICE ON THE CITY'S 
PLANNING COMMISSION 

Mayor Oden read aloud Resolution No. 2015-001 (Exhibit 1) and presented same to Mr. Davis. Mr. 
Davis in turn expressed his thanks to each of the members of the Planning Commission and City Planner, Dana 
Hazen. 

3. CONSENT AGENDA 

Council President Smith announced that the following matters will be considered at one time on the 
consent agenda provided no one in attendance objects: 

Approval of the minutes of the December 8,2014 regular meeting of the City Council 

Approval of the minutes of the December 16,2014 special meeting of the City Council 

2015-001 Expression of gratitude to Patrick Davis for his service on the Exhibit 1 
Mountain Brook Planning Commission 

2015-002 Set a public hearing for February 9,201 5 to consider an Exhibit 2 
ordinance adopting the 20 15 International Building Code, 20 15 
International Residential Code, 2015 International Fuel Gas 
Code, 20 15 International Mechanical Code, 20 15 International 
Plumbing Code, the 20 15 International Fire Code (all to become 
effective April 1, 20 15). 

January 12,201 5 



Minute Book 86 104 1 

2015-003 Authorize the execution of a Notice of Assignment between Exhibit 3 
Ajlouny Investments, LLC, and the City of Mountain Brook Appendix 1 
with respect to the assignment by Ajlouny Investments, LLC of 
the Development Agreement (20 14-1 70) and Parking 
Agreement (2014-172) as collateral for its Iberia Bank loan 
(Subject to additional language). 

2015-004 Award the bid for the purchase of uniforms for the Fire Exhibit 4 
Department (pricing guaranteed for one year with up to two Appendix 2 
annual renewals). 

2015-005 Authorize the execution of a service agreement between the Exhibit 5 
City and All In Mountain Brook to promote educational Appendix 3 
programs, speakers, communications, and related activities 
intended to raise community awareness regarding substance 
uselabuse, high risk behavior, preventable accidents, and mental 
health issues in consideration of $10,000. 

2015-006 Approve the conditional use (service) application submitted by Exhibit 6 
Rodney Fulmer for Mountain Brook Crossfit, LLC located at Appendix 4 
2703 Culver Road in Mountain Brook Village (local business 
district). 

2015-007 Authorize the execution of an agreement with the Birmingham- Exhibit 7 
Jefferson County Transit Authority (MAX) for their provision Appendix 5 
of public transportation services in the City for fiscal year 
ending September 30,2015. (Subject to obtaining Exhibit A - 
Routes and schedules) 

2015-008 Authorize the execution of a grant of acknowledgement, release Exhibit 8 
and indemnification from Dowd and Susan Ritter with respect Appendix 6 
to the City's approval of an exemption to the 2012 International 
Residential Code regulations for the property located at 405 
Club Place. 

Thereupon, the foregoing minutes and resolutions were introduced by Council President Smith and 
their immediate adoption was moved by Council President Pro Tempore Pritchard. The minutes and 
resolutions were then considered by the City Council. Council member Shelton seconded the motion to adopt 
the foregoing minutes and resolutions. Then, upon the question being put and the roll called, the vote was 
recorded as follows: 

Ayes: Virginia C. Smith, Council President 
William S. Pritchard, 111, Council President Pro Tempore 
Jack D. Carl 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice Womack 

Nays: None 

Council President Smith thereupon declared that said minutes and Resolution Nos. 201 5-001 through 
201 5-008 are adopted by a vote of 5--0. 

January 12,201 5 



Minute Book 86 

CONSIDERATION: ORDINANCE (NO. 1926) AMENDING CHAPTER 14 OF THE CITY 
CODE WITH RESPECT TO STORMWATER DETENTION PERMIT AND REVIEW FEES 
(APPENDIX 7) 

Council President Smith introduced the ordinance in writing and invited comments and questions from 
the audience. 

There being no further comments or discussion, Council President Smith called for motion regarding 
the proposal. Council President Pro Tempore Pritchard made a motion that all rules and regulations which, 
unless suspended, would prevent the immediate consideration and adoption of said ordinance be suspended, 
and that unanimous consent to the immediate consideration of said ordinance is given and that the reading of 
the ordinance at length be waived. The motion was seconded by Council member Womack and was carried, as 
follows: 

Ayes: 

Nays: 

Virginia Smith, Council President 
William S. Pritchard, 111, Council President Pro Tempore 
Jack D. Carl 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 

None 

The President of the Council declared the motion carried by a vote of 5--0. 

After said ordinance had been considered in full by the Council, Council President Pro Tempore 
Pritchard then moved for the adoption of said ordinance. The motion was seconded by Council member 
Shelton. Thereupon, Council President Smith called for vote with the following results: 

Ayes: 

Nays: 

Virginia Smith, Council President 
William S. Pritchard, 111, Council President Pro Tempore 
Jack D. Carl 
Lloyd C. Shelton 
Alice B. Womack 

None 

The President of the Council declared that the said ordinance (No. 1926) is hereby adopted by a vote 
of 5 - 0  and, as evidence thereof, she signed the same. 

5. ANNOUNCEMENTS REGARDING THE NEXT REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY 
COUNCIL 

Council President Smith announced that the next meeting of the Mountain Brook City Council will be 
held on Monday January 26,2015 at 7:00 p.m. in the Council Chamber of City Hall located at 56 Church 
Street, Mountain Brook, AL 35213. Please visit the City's web site (www.mtnbrook.org) for more 
information. 

6. ADJOURNMENT 

There being no further business to come before the City Council, President Smith adjourned the 
meeting. 

Steven Boone, City ~ k r k  

January 12.2015 



Minute Book 86 

EXHIBIT 1 

RESOLUTION NO. 2015-001 

WHEREAS, Patrick B. Davis, Jr., has served with distinction on the Mountain Brook Planning 
Commission from July 23, 200 1, through December 3 1, 20 14, having served as Vice-Chairman from 2003- 
2009 and Chairman from 2010-2014; and 

WHEREAS, Patrick B. Davis, Jr., proved to be invaluable as Vice-Chairman of the Zoning 
Ordinance Review Committee, Vice-Chairman of the Land Use Plan Project Steering Committee and the 
committee to revise the City's Master Plan; his expert architectural insight and strategic leadership capabilities 
being invaluable in establishing a legacy of sound city planning for years to come; and 

WHEREAS, Patrick B. Davis, Jr.'s, sense of humor was an added benefit to the Planning 
Commission's regular meetings; and 

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the residents of Mountain Brook to express their gratitude to Patrick B. 
Davis, Jr., for his unselfish service and tireless efforts while serving on the Planning Commission and 
numerous ad-hoc committees. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council and Mayor, on behalf of the 
residents of Mountain Brook, do publicly thank Patrick B. Davis, Jr., for his exemplary service and wish him 
well in future endeavors. 

EXHIBIT 2 

RESOLUTION NO. 2015-002 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook that, at the meeting of the City 
Council to be held on Monday, February 9,2015 at 7:00 p.m., in the Council Chamber of the Mountain Brook 
City Hall, the City Council will hold a public hearing regarding the adoption of an ordinance repealing 
Sections 109-3 1, 109-32, 109-1 95, 109-227, and 18-20 of the City Code and adopting 20 15 versions of 
specified technical codes relating to inspection activities, enforcement of building provisions as provided in 
said codes and fire prevention. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook that the City 
Clerk be, and he hereby is, authorized and directed to publish in accordance with applicable state law, by 
posting in four (4) conspicuous places within the City of Mountain Brook, as follows: City Hall, 56 Church 
Street, Gilchrist Drug Company, 2805 Cahaba Road, Overton Park, 3020 Overton Road, and The Invitation 
Place, 3 150 Overton Road, a notice in words and figures substantially as follows: 

"ZONING NOTICE 

Notice is hereby given that at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook to 
be held on Monday, February 9,2015, at 7:00 p.m., in the Council Chamber of the Mountain Brook City Hall 
located at 56 Church Street, Mountain Brook, Alabama 35213, the City Council will hold a public hearing 
regarding a proposal that the City Council adopt an ordinance in words and figures substantially as follows: 

'ORDINANCE NO. 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING SECTIONS 109-31,109-32,109-195,109-227, AND 18-20 
OF THE CITY CODE AND ADOPTING 2015 VERSIONS OF SPECIFIED TECHNICAL CODES 
RELATING TO INSPECTION ACTIVITIES, ENFORCEMENT OF BUILDING PROVISIONS AS 

PROVIDED IN SAID CODES AND FIRE PREVENTION 

January 12,20 15 



1044 Minute Book 86 

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama (the "City Council") 
heretofore has adopted various technical codes promulgated by the International Code Council (the "ICC") and 
the National Fire Protection Association relating to buildings, residences and other structures in the City of 
Mountain Brook (the "City"), and operations in the City concerning fuel gas, mechanical, plumbing, and fire 
protection and life safety (collectively, the "Technical Codes"); 

WHEREAS, the City Council desires that, except to the extent specified herein, the City adopt, the 
201 5 versions of the Technical Codes (the "201 5 Technical Codes") that are specified herein for use and 
application for buildings and structures within its corporate limits; 

WHEREAS, the adoption of the 2015 Technical Codes by reference is authorized by $1 1-45-8 Code 
of Alabama (1975); and 

WHEREAS, the adoption of the 2015 Technical Codes will facilitate the performance of inspection 
activities by the City, and promote the public safety, health and general welfare of its citizens and owners, 
occupants and users of buildings and structures in the City. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City as follows: 

Section 1. Section 109-3 1 of the City Code is hereby repealed and replaced with the following: 

"Sec. 109-31. Building Codes-Adoption by reference. 

(a) Except as provided herein, the International Building Code - 2015 Edition 
("ICC Building Code") and International Residential Code - 2015 Edition (the 
"IRC"), both published by the ICC and available for purchase at 900 Montclair Road, 
Birmingham, Alabama, are hereby adopted as the Building Code of the City by 
reference as though they were copied herein. 

(b) With respect to the ICC Building Code and the IRC, the City modifies the forms 
proposed by the ICC as follows: 

(i) Section TA1101.4. of ICC Building Code - Referenced codes: The 
following codes that are referenced in this Section of the ICC Building 
Code are not adopted: (a) the International Property Maintenance Code 
referenced in Section 10 1.4.4; and (b) the International Existing Building 
Code referenced in Section 101.4.7. 

(ii) Section TAl 109.2 of ICC build in^ Code & Section R108.2 of IRC - 
Schedule of Permit Fees: These Sections are not adopted in the form 
proposed by the ICC, and are replaced in their entirety with the following: 

Schedule of Permit Fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, 
gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a 
permit, a fee or fees as set forth in City Code Section 14-1 shall 
be paid at the time of filing application, in accordance with such 
fee schedule as shall be set from time to time by the city council. 
A list of such fees shall be kept on file in the city clerk's office. 

(iii) Sections TAl 1 1 1.1 of ICC Building Code & R1lO.l of IRC - Use and 
Occupanc~. These Sections are not adopted in the form proposed by the 
ICC, and are replaced in their entirety with the following: 

"Use and occupancy. No residential building or structure shall 
be used or occupied, and no change in the existing occupancy 
classification of a residential building or structure or portion 
thereof shall be made until the building official has issued a 
certificate of occupancy which has been signed by the building 

January 12,2015 



Minute Book 86 

official and the City Manager. No commercial building or 
structure shall be used or occupied, and no change in the existing 
occupancy classification of a commercial building or structure or 
portion thereof shall be made until the building official has 
issued a certificate of occupancy which has been signed by the 
building official, the fire official, and the City Manager. A 
certificate of occupancy shall not be issued until after the City 
Manager shall have determined that the building conforms to all 
provisions and regulations of the city with respect thereto, 
including its use under the zoning ordinances of the city. A 
certificate of occupancy (whether a temporary certificate of the 
regular certificate) issued without the signature or the building 
official, fire official (in the case of commercial buildings), and 
the City Manager shall not be deemed to be a certificate of 
occupancy issued under this code or under the city's zoning 
ordinance. 

(iv) Sections [A1 1 13 of ICC Building Code & R112 of the IRC - Board of 
Avueals. These Sections are not adopted in the form proposed by the ICC, 
and are replaced in their entirety with the following: 

"Appeals regarding the application of the adopted building codes 
may be presented to the City Manager for consideration. The 
City Manager may elect to render a decision on such appeal or 
remand the appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. In cases 
where the appeal is heard by the City Manager and a decision is 
rendered, the appellant, if not satisfied with the decision, may 
then appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. 

The board of zoning adjustment of the City of Mountain Brook, 
Alabama, as said board is prescribed by Section 11-52-80 Code 
of Alabama (1975), as amended, shall constitute a board of 
adjustments and appeals under these codes." 

(v) Sections [All 14.4 of ICC Building Code & R113.4 of IRC- Violation 
Penalties. These Sections are not adopted in the form proposed by the 
ICC, and are replaced in their entirety with the following: 

R113.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who violates a 
provision of these codes or fails to comply with any of the 
requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 
building or structure in violation of the approved construction 
documents or directive of the building official, or of a permit or 
certificate issued under the provisions of these codes, shall be 
subject to penalties as prescribed by law. 

In instances where a person commences work prior to making 
application for a required permit, all applicable permit fees shall 
be doubled. Once notified in writing by the building official of 
the City that a report or building permit application must be 
submitted, such person must submit such report within ten (10) 
days. Persons who fail to make such report within the time 
period required shall be subject to additional penalties as 
provided under Sec. 1-6.1 of the City Code and by 3 13A- 10-4 of 
the Code of Alabama. 

January 12,2015 



Minute Book 86 

(vi) Chapter 11 of IRC- Enerrrv Efficiencv. This Chapter is adopted 
except as follows: (a) notwithstanding any provisions contained in 
Chapter 11 or elsewhere in the IRC, the Energy Efficiency requirements in 
the IRC shall not be applicable to the repair, renovation, alteration or 
reconstruction of existing buildings and structures; and (b) the minimum 
standards for insulation to be used in connection with the repair, 
renovation, alteration or reconstruction of existing buildings and structures 
shall not be less than R-30 for ceiling spaces, R-13 for walls and R-19 for 
floors. 

(vii) Section P2904 of the IRC- Dwelling Unit Fire Sprinkler Systems. 
This Section is adopted, but the following provision is added as P2904.8.9: 

P2904.8.9 Residential Sprinkler Exemption. Notwithstanding 
any provision in this Section P2904 or elsewhere in the IRC, any 
homeowner, upon application to the City's building official, may 
request an exemption to the sprinkler system requirements of 
P2904.1 for a dwelling and such exemption shall be granted 
upon satisfaction of each of the following: 

a. The applicant must either confer with the City Fire Marshal 
or his or her designee about the benefits of installing a 
residential fire sprinkler system or review presentation materials 
developed by the Fire Marshal concerning sprinkler systems; 

b. The applicant must certify that he or she has met the 
requirements in subsection (a) above, and fully understands and 
acknowledges the risks of opting not to install a residential fire 
sprinkler system; 

Exceptions: 

i. No exemption shall be granted for any dwelling 
constructed less than 5 feet from the property line; and 

ii. No exemption shall be granted for 2-family dwelling 
units." 

Section 2. Section 109-32 of the City Code, which reflected amendments to the previously enacted 
Section 109-3 1, is hereby repealed and replaced by the following: 

"Sec. 109-32. Same - Amendments - Reserved." 

Section 3. Section 109-195 of the City Code is repealed and replaced with the following: 

"Sec. 109-195. Gas and Mechanical Codes-Adoption by reference. 

(a) Except as provided herein, the International Fuel Gas Code - 2015 Edition (the 
"Gas Code") and International Mechanical Code - 2015 Edition (the "Mechanical 
Code"), both published by International Code Council ("ICC") and available for 
purchase at 900 Montclair Road, Birmingham, Alabama, are hereby adopted as the 
Gas and Mechanical Code of the City by reference as though they were copied 
herein." 

(b) With respect to the Gas Code and the Mechanical Code, the City amends the form 
proposed by the ICC as follows: 

January 12,2015 



Minute Book 86 

(i) Sections [A1 106.6.2 of Gas Code & [A1 106.5.2 of Mechanical Code - 
Fee Schedule. These Sections are not adopted in the form proposed by the 
ICC, and are replaced in their entirety with the following: 

"Schedule of Permit Fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, 
gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a 
permit, a fee or fees as set forth in City Code Section 14-1 shall 
be paid at the time of filing application, in accordance with such 
fee schedule as shall be set from time to time by the city council. 
A list of such fees shall be kept on file in the city clerk's office." 

(ii) Sections TAl 108.4 of Gas Code & Mechanical Codes- Violation 
Penalties. These Sections are not adopted in the form proposed by the 
ICC, and are replaced in their entirety with the following: 

"[A] 108.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who violates a 
provision of these codes or fails to comply with any of the 
requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 
building or structure in violation of the approved construction 
documents or directive of the building official, or of a permit or 
certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 
subject to penalties as prescribed by law. 

In instances where a person commences work prior to making 
application for a required permit, all applicable permit fees shall 
be doubled. Once notified in writing by the building official of 
the City that a report or building permit application must be 
submitted, such person must submit such report within ten (10) 
days. Persons who fail to make such report within the time 
period required shall be subject to additional penalties as 
provided under Sec. 1-6.1 of the city code and by 8 13A-10-4 of 
the Code of Alabama." 

(iii) Sections 109 of Gas Code & Mechanical Code - Means of Appeals. 
These Sections in these codes are not adopted in the form proposed by the 
ICC, and are replaced in their entirety with the following: 

"Appeals regarding the application of the adopted building codes 
may be presented to the City Manager for consideration. The 
City Manager may elect to render a decision on such appeal or 
remand the appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. In cases 
where the appeal is heard by the City Manager and a decision is 
rendered, the appellant, if not satisfied with the decision, may 
then appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. 

The board of zoning adjustment of the City of Mountain Brook, 
Alabama, as said board is prescribed by Section 11-52-80 Code 
of Alabama (1975), as amended, shall constitute a board of 
adjustments and appeals under these codes." 

Section 4. Section 109-227 of the City Code is repealed and replaced with the following: 

"Sec. 109-227. Plumbing Code-Adoption by reference. 

(a) Except as provided herein, the International Plumbing Code - 2015 Edition 
published by International Code Council ("ICC") (the "Plumbing Code) and 

J:Winutes & Agendas\CouncilUO15\20150112 Minutes.doc January 12,201 5 



Minute Book 86 

available for purchase at 900 Montclair Road, Birmingham, Alabama, is hereby 
adopted as the Plumbing Code of the City by reference as though it were copied 
herein. 

(b) With respect to the Plumbing Code, the City amends the form proposed by the 
ICC as follows: 

(i) Section TAl 106.6.2 of Plumbing Code - Fee Schedule. This Section is 
not adopted in the form proposed by the ICC, and is replaced in its entirety 
with the following: 

Schedule of Permit Fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, 
gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a 
permit, a fee or fees as set forth in City Code Section 14-1 shall 
be paid at the time of filing application, in accordance with such 
fee schedule as shall be set from time to time by the city council. 
A list of such fees shall be kept on file in the city clerk's office. 

(ii) Section TAl 108.4 of Plumbing Code - Violation Penalties. This 
Section is not adopted, and is replaced in its entirety with the following: 

[A] 108.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who violates a 
provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the 
requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 
building or structure in violation of the approved construction 
documents or directive of the building official, or of a permit or 
certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 
subject to penalties as prescribed by law. 

In instances where a person commences work prior to making 
application for a required permit, all applicable permit fees shall 
be doubled. Once notified in writing by the building official of 
the City that a report or building permit application must be 
submitted, such person must submit such report within ten (10) 
days. Persons who fail to make such report within the time 
period required shall be subject to additional penalties as 
provided under Sec. 1-6.1 of the City Code and by 9 13A-10-4 of 
the Code of Alabama." 

(iii) Section 109 of Plumbing Code - Means of Appeals. This Section is not 
adopted and is replaced in its entirety with the following: 

Appeals regarding the application of the adopted building code 
may be presented to the city manager for consideration. The 
City Manager may elect to render a decision on such appeal or 
remand the appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. In cases 
where the appeal is heard by the City Manager and a decision is 
rendered, the appellant, if not satisfied with the decision, may 
then appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. 

The board of zoning adjustment of the City of Mountain Brook, 
Alabama, as said board is prescribed by Section 11-52-80 Code 
of Alabama (1975), as amended, shall constitute a board of 
adjustments and appeals under this code." 

Section 5. Section 18-20 of the City Code is repealed and replaced with the following: 

"Sec. 18-20. Fire Prevention Code - Adoption by reference 

January 12,20 15 



Minute Book 86 

(a) Except as provided herein, the International Fire Code - 2015 Edition published 
by the International Code Council ("ICC") and available for purchase at 900 
Montclair Road, Birmingham, Alabama (the "Fire Code"), and the Life Safety Code 
JNFPA 101) - 201 5 Edition, available for purchase from the National Fire Protection 
Association, 1 Batterymarch Park, Quincy, MA, or by calling (800) 344-3555 (the 
"Life Safety Code"), are hereby adopted as the Fire Prevention Code of the City by 
reference as though they were copied herein. 

(b) With respect to the Fire Code, the City amends the form proposed by the ICC as 
follows: 

(i) Section 108 - Board of Auueals. This Section of the Fire Code is not 
adopted and is replaced in its entirety with the following: 

Appeals regarding the application of the adopted code may be 
presented to the city manager for consideration. The city 
manager may elect to render a decision on such appeal or 
remand the appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. In cases 
where the appeal is heard by the city manager and a decision is 
rendered, the appellant, if not satisfied with the decision, may 
then appeal to the board of zoning adjustment. 

The board of zoning adjustment of the City of Mountain Brook, 
Alabama, as said board is prescribed by Section 11-52-80 Code 
of Alabama (1975), as amended, shall constitute a board of 
adjustments and appeals under this code. 

(ii) Section TAl 109.4 - Violation Penalties. This Section of the Fire Code 
is not adopted and is replaced in its entirety with the following: 

[A] 109.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who violates a 
provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the 
requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 
building or structure in violation of the approved construction 
documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or 
certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 
subject to penalties as prescribed by law. 

In instances where a person commences work prior to making 
application for a required permit, all applicable permit fees shall 
be doubled. Once notified in writing by the building or fire 
official of the City that a report or building permit application 
must be submitted, such person must submit such report within 
ten (10) days. Persons who fail to make such report within the 
time period required shall be subject to additional penalties as 
provided under Sec. 1-6.1 of the City Code and by § 13A- 10-4 of 
the Code of Alabama." 

(iii) Section TAl 113.2 - Schedule of permit fees. This Section of the Fire 
Code is not adopted, and is replaced in its entirety with the following: 

Schedule of Permit Fees. On buildings, structures, and other 
matters under this code that require a permit, a fee or fees as set 
forth in City Code Section 14-1 shall be paid at the time of filing 
application, in accordance with such fee schedule as shall be set 

January 12,20 15 



Minute Book 86 

from time to time by the City Council. A list of such fees shall 
be kept on file in the City Clerk's office. 

(iv) Section 912.2 - Location (of Fire Devartment Connections). This 
Section of the Fire Code is not adopted, and is replaced in its entirety with 
the following: 

9.1.2.2 Location. Fire department connections shall be located 
not more than 100 feet from the nearest fire hydrant. With 
respect to hydrants, driveways, buildings and landscaping, fire 
department connections shall be so located that the fire 
apparatus and hose connected to supply the system will not 
obstruct access to the buildings for other fire apparatus. The 
location of the department connections shall be approved by the 
fire chief or fire official. 

(v) Adovtion of Certain Avvendices: The provisions of Appendix B - Fire- 
Flow Requirements for Buildings, Appendix C - Fire Hydrant Locations 
and Distribution, and Appendix D -Fire Apparatus Access Roads each are 
adopted in their entirety. 

(c) With respect to the Life Safety Code, the City amends the form proposed by the 
National Fire Protection Association as follows: 

(i) Chapter 24 - One-and Two Family Dwellings. This Chapter is not 
adopted. 

(ii) Reserved." 

Section 6. This ordinance is cumulative in nature and is in addition to any power and authority which 
the City of Mountain Brook may have under any other ordinance or law. 

Section 7. If any part, section or subdivision of this ordinance shall be held unconstitutional or invalid 
for any reason, such holding shall not be construed to invalidate or impair the remainder of this ordinance, 
which shall continue in full force and effect, notwithstanding such holding. 

Section 8. Any provisions herein that the City has adopted that deviate from the Technical Codes that 
are adopted by reference shall prevail over any conflicting provision of those Technical Codes. All other 
ordinances or parts of ordinances heretofore adopted by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, 
Alabama, which are inconsistent with the provisions of this ordinance, are hereby expressly repealed. 

In addition, when a provision in the adopted Technical Codes or this Ordinance refers to the duties of 
certain named officials, the official of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama whose duties most closely 
correspond to those of such named official shall be deemed the official responsible for the enforcement of said 
provision. 

Section 9. The effective date of this Ordinance shall be April I ,  201 5.' 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Clerk be, and he hereby is, further authorized and 
directed to give written notice of the hearing to the owners of the property located in whole or in part within 
500 feet from the boundaries of the property described in this resolution in the form and manner and within the 
time required by Act No. 1 123 of the 1973 Regular Session of the Legislature of Alabama. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Clerk be, and hereby is, further authorized and directed 
to post the Notice herein above set out, which includes the proposed ordinance, in four conspicuous places 
within the City in accordance with applicable state law. 

January 12,20 15 



Minute Book 86 

EXHIBIT 3 

RESOLUTION NO. 2015-003 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that the City 
Council hereby authorizes the execution a Notice of Assignment, in the form as attached hereto as Exhibit A, 
with respect to the assignment by Ajlouny Investments, LLC of its Development Agreement (2014-070) and 
Parking Agreement (2014-072) as collateral for its Iberia Bank loan. 

APPENDIX 1 

EXHIBIT 4 

RESOLUTION NO. 2015-004 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that the Fire 
Department uniform bid submitted by Municipal and Commercial Uniforms and Equipment (MAC Uniforms), 
being the only bid submitted and determined to be in conformance with the expressed specifications, is hereby 
accepted. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that 
the City Manager is hereby authorized and directed, for and on behalf of the City, to issue a [blanket] purchase 
order to MAC Uniforms and to execute any other documents that may be determined to be necessary with 
respect to said uniform purchases. 

APPENDIX 2 

EXHIBIT 5 

RESOLUTION NO. 2015-005 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that either the 
Mayor or the City Manager of the City is hereby authorized and directed, for and on behalf of the City, to enter 
into an agreement with All In Mountain Brook, in the form as attached hereto as Exhibit A, subject to such 
minor changes as may be determined appropriate by the City Attorney. 

APPENDIX 3 

EXHIBIT 6 

RESOLUTION NO. 2015-006 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that the City 
Council hereby approves the conditional service use application submitted by Rodney Fulmer for Mountain 
Brook Crossfit, LLC to allow exercise classes and personal training at 2703 Culver Road. 

APPENDIX 4 

January 12,20 15 



Minute Book 86 

EXHIBIT 7 

RESOLUTION NO. 2015-007 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that the City 
Council hereby authorizes the execution the Birmingham-Jefferson County Transit Authority (MAX) fiscal 
2015 Transit Service Agreement, in the form as attached hereto as Exhibit A. 

APPENDIX 5 

EXHIBIT 8 

RESOLUTION NO. 2015-008 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama, that the City 
Council hereby authorizes the Mayor or the City Manager of the City to execute a Grant of Acknowledgment, 
Release, and Indemnification instrument, in the form as attached hereto as Exhibit A, with respect to the City's 
approval of an exemption to specified building code regulations for the residence located at 405 Club Place. 

APPENDIX 6 

APPENDIX 7 

ORDINANCE NO. 1926 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 14 OF THE CITY CODE WITH RESPECT TO 
STORMWATER DETENTION PERMIT AND REVIEW FEES 

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Mountain Brook that Chapter 14, of the Code 
of the City of Mountain Brook, Alabama ("City Code") shall be amended as follows: 

Section 1. Section 14-1 of the City Code shall be amended as follows with respect to the fees 
associated with Chapter 1 13 of the City Code: 

Section 2. This ordinance is cumulative in nature and is in addition to any power and authority which 
the City of Mountain Brook may have under any other ordinance or law. 

J:\Minutes & Agendas\CouncilL?015\20 1501 12 Minutes.doc 

Section of Code 

113-55 
1 13-229(d) 

1 13-229(d) 

1 1 3-229(d) 

1 13-229(d) 

113-229(f)(2) 

January 12,201 5 

Description 
CHAPTER 113 

ENVIRONMENT AND NATRAL RESOURCE 
MANAGEMENT 

Soil erosion and sediment control permit fee 
Stormwater detention review fee - for project in single family residential 
district 
Stormwater detention review fee - for project in multifamily district & all 
other projects requiring Stormwater Detention Permit 
Stormwater detention permit fee - for project in single family residential 
district 
Stormwater detention permit fee - for project in multifamily district & all 
other projects requiring Stormwater Detention Permit 
Fee for appeal of adverse action on stormwater detention application 

Fee 
(in dollars) 

1,000.00 

500.00 
1,000.00 

500.00 
1,000.00 

100.00 



Minute Book 86 1053 

Section 3. If any part, section or subdivision of this ordinance shall be held unconstitutional or invalid 
for any reason, such holding shall not be construed to invalidate or impair the remainder of this 
ordinance, which shall continue in full force and effect notwithstanding such holding. 

Section 4. This section shall become effective immediately upon adoption and publication as provided 
by law. 

January 12,20 15 



Minute Book 86 

NOTICE OF ASSIGNMENT 

TO: Ci*dManruinBdAl.b.rm 
so ad Sum, 
M o u n a  BmokrUlbrrm 35213 

RE: Ta Rwmw S M a 8 m d  l d w  Agwued 

By I Monp- I~*N o r n o  ond-. Md ycvUy Agunru (Ihr %&qe') hod 
m L d m ~ d a 1 0 M A B I . 3 A I ( b - ~ ~ " ) m l ~ ~ t h P D b S A I U ) ~ Y  
m. UC. m Ahbum l i i lod  li.bilily mmpny (tbc "Owdl hr mllumlly 
vri& m IBERIABANK. a hirim lUrc Wn# -h ( b  Wwlpprr"). tbc Zos 
Rnmrv S h e o n l  J w d v  &emen1 (Ilw 'Paclqmrd Agammr] Mrr mad inIo 
vilh the CITY OF MOUNTAIN BROOK, ALABAMA (& "CiIfl on W 16. MI4 
md the Parti* Apmm~, dud M lXccmba 16, 1014 (tho "P- A w n  
[Clp'ulizd cPmt d bsdn not dcrwd Ih.Il bo dcfmd in uradmu. mIh he 
tsrm Of& r l d o p m o t  ApmIlmI.1 

2 T b c a ~ k ~ p n r c I h r I h c D c v ~ I ~ d P ~ t h ~ i h n h  
mhmUy ua& by O m a  ID M- 

3. ~ b c  City mi5 and ulmaulodaa Uu G-ma b mmplrd & RojoSt m 
Mmpp in &a rib Ihe tarm ofthe Mongl .  and h A@ummC' 

6. U p  dr l ivq  lo M p p c  ortbc 11200,XO Lump Sum P a m 1  ul lonb in sca%a 
,.I(.) oftbcDabpzaU- mll uvlotb.C%ud~ &wAccen 
P u s t l . n d I h o P u f d q M ~ m b o m I r v r d I m m I h ~ I ( ~ ~ o l I l w ~  

I. Tho Cuy r a o d  and -1- dut hna hu a p d  viIb Morryw thal tbc 
Cam g m d  lo Ilw Cily in ch b v r l q m ~  ~s-mwat ir aub~omOMmp~, a d  

VwTruly Yarn 

Whit C0lrih Fm. 

Re: Ajlouny Investmenu. L1.C ! l k i a  B d  
Notice of Assignment 

Dtar Whit: 

E s l o x d  rrleut find tuv execution c o ~ i n  of the r ~ w d  Notice o fku i~nment  betwsn Ailounv 
lovntmeris LLC md the CiIy o f ~ o k u i n  Brook Al- s ipcd  by~j louny  lavntmck. ~LC. 
P l w  d o n e  oftbe execution cogiu a me lor deliver) lo Ibcria Bank, 

ThnnL you for your assistance and eoopruion. If you have my quertiws, p l ~ e  I n  me know 

January 12,2015 



CITY OF MOUNTAIN BROOK FIRE DEPARTMENT 
102 Tibbetl Street, Mounmin Bmk. Alahnu - 35213 Phone: (205) 802-3838, Fnx: (205) 879-5919 

CITY O F  MOUNTAIN BROOK 
56 Church Street 

MOUNTAIN BROOK, ALABAMA 35213 
OFFICE OF PURCHASINGAGENT (CITY MNAGER) 

INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM 
BID COVER SHEET 

TO: Sam Gaston, Ciy Ma11 
FROM. Robert Ezekiel, Fire 
DATE: January 6,2015 

SUBJECT: Uniform Bid 

Bid Request Ported thls Date: Tuesdav. December 02.2014 

Blds to be Opened tbih Date aud Time: Mondav. Januaw 5.2015 at 2:00 D-m. 

To Whom It May Concern: 

Bid8 shall bc scaled and delivered to the Omcc of the Purchasing Agent in the City Hall, City of Mount~ln 
Brook, Alabama, prior to the above specified data and time. Bids shall be publicly opened at the date and time In accordance with State bid law and City putchasing policy, specifications were developed and 

a r e q u a  for bids for fire departme~lt uniforms was posted on December 2, 2014. A brmal bid 
opening was held in the ofice of the City Mnnager at 2:00 PM on January 5,2013. 

speeiKcd above or as soon M practicable thereafter. 

To be considered by the Clty, SI bid must comply with Alnbama law, includfng, but not limited to, Ah. Code 
(1975) $w1-16-50 cf  sq. and 31-13-1 el seq.. and provide documentation of e~~rollmcnr in the E-Verlfy program 
pursuant to AIa. Code 831-13-9. 

There was one hid submined and rrreived. hlunicipol and Commel.cial Uniforms and 
Equipment :h4AC, was the bidder at 3774.84. 

All biddera must use tbe bid form provided by the City for the project. This Bid Cover. Sllnt should bc 
completed and submitted with the bid. Bids compicted in pencil will not be accepted. Bid. sbould be dearly 
marlted -SEALED BID" and indlcate on the outride of the envelope "UNIFORM BID - FIRE DEPTn and the date 
of bid opening. 

Sote: The bid price ofS774.84 is not an amount that twill be paid for uniforms. 11 is simply an 
indicator of the wst of all uniform items overall with a factor of life expectant). built in 
~magnitwle factor!. The department has an annual unibrm allotvance of S450 per rmployee. 
So, the FY2015 operating budget is reflecti\e of the clothing allowance and not the bid price 
amount. The City rucrvu the right to require a bid bond, in which case specific information shall be provided with m 

the request for bids. 
Our historical experience with iMAC uniforms has been very good. Therefore, w e  rrspcrtfully 
request that this bid be a w d e d  to MAC uniforms and that 11 Ix placed on the City Council 
agenda for consideration and hopefully allinnation. 

The City reserves the rigbt to utilize Ufe cycle cost analysls in determining the lowest responsible bidder, in 
whicb care specific information shall be pmvided with the q u e s t  for blds. 0 

k 
The City reserves the r4ght to accept or reject any o z h i d s  nnd t=ive formalities. 

As always, ifanyone has any questions, I \\ill he awlable to respond. 

Sam S. Gaston, City Manager and Purchasing Agent 
\-' 

d&> Phone: ~$25: , %?Y & Q-'? 

STATE: @* 
U 

sm AMOUNT (AS PER SPECIFICATMINS) s 779% 
Nofc MUNICIPALITIES ARE EXEMPT PROMSTATE MLES TAX 

I 

Title: Notary Pnblic 
My Commission Expires: 

APPENDIX 2 



MOUNTAIN BROOK FIRE DEPARTMENT 
UNIFORM SPECIFICATIONS, NOVEMBER 2014 

APPENDIX 2 



- 
VI TOTAL BID (THIS IS YOUR BID!) 

7 s 
a BIDS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED ON INDIVIDUAL UNITS - BIDS WILL BE CONSIDERED ON TOTAL 
5 BID. 2 
h. 0 No definite quantitiw for each item can be established at tbis t imr 
0 

(62) Firefibten and Fire Omcem will purchase the Items Iited in rppmpriate quant t ia  and s h a  acwnlkg to 
need and p r i a  

Bidr should include the cart of any alterations or adjwtmenb nenrsry.  All memben of the department WIII be 
clothed regardim of slze and o r  gender, no exceptions. 

PI- indluteyour delivery Erom time of awarding of contract: 3 L 9  f r  e n  F. v, 
J D & ~ L  d n  L-eQrAd' 

No G r a t c r  Than 90 Days is acceptable, unleg special 0 e n  a n  luvol ed. Special orden m b t  completed in 
120 days from the day oforder.) 

MUNICIPALITIES ARE EXEMPT FROM -ATE SALES TAX 

This bid must be notarized. 

Sworn to and subscribed before me this &day o&, 20& 

APPENDIX 2 



Minute Book 86 

STATE OF ALABAMA 1 

coum OP JEPYERSON 

THIS AGREEMENT b c n t e d  into on this Ihc ~ b d n y  of J m w ,  2015, by nnd 
b-n tht CIty of Mountain Brwk (hucimfxu referred to u "City") and All In Mnmtdn 
Bmok @ucinr&u rcfcnsd to as ''ConlracIor''): 

WHEREAS, municipalities in the Sute of Alatama are aulhorircd to promote the public 
hsJlth &ty, morals, d t y .  prosperity. wntcntmcnt ud the g c n d  w c l h  of the 
wmmunitr. 

WHEREAS. All In Mountain Bmok is m orplmtion which hu u o n  of iu g d s  the 
pomotion of public hulth. ufcty, mods, rswity, prosperity, WnIenunW and the g c n d  
w c l f ~  in tht City of Mountain Bmk-%puifically. the e~~ ud pmtation of thc liva 
of Mountain Bmok youth; 

WHEREAS, the City Council of thc City of Mountain Bmok, Alabama desks  lo cntcr 
into a c o m e t  with the Convrnor for the purpose of providing services and resourau to 
reridmu of the City of Mountain Bmok whlch arc designed to wmbu issues and problems 1ha1 
p l m  the lives md well-bei of Mountain Bmok youth .t ri*, 

I. ThDt the City. for and in w n d a I i o n  of tht c o v e ~ ~ u  md agreemenu 
haeirultn wf out to be !up1 and performed by the Conmaor, d m  hucby qrec to poy Ihc 
Canhrlor the nun of S IO.0W.W (Tm 7houund and N d l  W Dollars) (hucinafIer refmed to u 
Lhc "Conlracl Amount") for perfonin8 the rav ica  herein prwided for the period kginning 
October 1.2014. Ihrough SepIembu 30.201S. 

In wnsidencioo of tht s o v m I a  ud .pr+nwnlr nude hnei by Ihc Cily. Ik Conmaor 
thu the Cmlnclor &hall bc touUy responsible for. and hall have eaclwiw wnbul o m ,  

the rrrrmpmcnt and dirburrmcnt of the Canmct Amount, and thu Ihc Cmlrnct Amount shall 
be used dy for the purposes herein dereribcd: 

r To undvwile All In Mounuin Bmok programming u the six Mountain Bmok 
City ~hools.  thereby largetins f i l i a  and youth in prndcs Kindcrpm lhmuph MlRh 
mdc, Including but w t  limltsd to All In Mounuin Bmok s p c a k ~ ~ ,  Mivitic.. auvim, 
d d d h  ud wmmunicotion, daiimcd to wmbat luvsr ud pmblmu hat plaa the 
livu and well-bei of tdcmdn Br&k youth .t rirk 

b. Activitiu will be p h c d  by apqointcd Parent Tcschu Orplniution 
reprrwnutiva in cach school, dong with admmmalon ud school counrclon 

c Conmaor anlicipafa the following disbvnemcnt of thc w n m n  amount 

(I) S5,WO.W to Mountain Bmok High School; 

(2) S3,W0.00 to Mountain Brook Junior High School; and 

(3) $2.000.00 (SSO0.00 opica) w the f o u  elmcnury shools-Bmokwocd 
F o M  EluncnUry School. Chaukee Bend Efemcnury School. CnsUine 
Elmenbry Schwl. and Mountain Bmok Elemcnw Schwl; 

6 Conmclor wcu to pmvidc my and d l  permnnel suppliu. ~ d l o r  equipment 
noccyuy for thc sen'iou husin to be provided. 

3. The Conmuor a w  to provide lo the City d d l  m l u b l e  Iima md plra,  an 
acwunting of Lhc Conlnctor's expendinu'e of the Contnct Amount 

4. The Canmaor h d l  not bansfer or lrripn this w n m  or any of the righa md 
privilqa g m u d  hucin wilhout the prior millen wnrent of the City. 

5. The Conlnclar a a e u  thtrmn vioYInofmv ofthe covu~cn.ntr ud meemen0 
hminwnuioed, on ascount ofiny sct or dmiuionofthc ~ot jnc lor ,  the City nuy. at Tu option, 
d n a t c  and u ~ c l  this w n m a  and to excruse MY remedy. at Iu opdoh available lo it 
whether in low or equity. 

6. The ConIrastor a g ~  it will comply wifh n t le  6 of thc Civll Righu Act of 1964 
lrwinp hat no pcmn under i u  employ will k excluded fmm pvlicipntion In. be denied 
bcnefiu of, or othmvirc be subjected to discrimination on the gram& of m, am, wlor, 
naliorul origin or handicap. 

7. Nohvithrundinn mv of the othcl mvisloru contained in this w n W .  the Citv 
shall nuintaio the right to &e this conma'upon proper notice, which shdl be In miti& 
ud sMl be provided to the C o n M o r  ol lean 30 daya prior to the h d e d  &te ofunallatlon 

I. ExccpI u o I h W  exprsrrly provided in this AgrecmcnI, my notice, caurm or 
other sommuniation m u i d  or armitlcd under thb Anrsancnl must be in witinn md will be 
d e e d  ~ i v c d  a th; timc it'is pqraully deli&, on thc day it b scnl ky b i m i l c  
Ilanrmiaion. on Ihe ossond &y afla IU deposit with my cornmucid air wwier or u p r m  
auviee, or. ifmaild. three days afla thc m t i a  is dcpmitsd in (he Umted S a a  mdl ddrrru6 

To City of Mountain Bmk:  City Manager 
City of Mountain Bmok 
Post Offia Box 130009 
Mountain Bmok, Alabanu 35213 

All In MounUin Bmok 
Leigh Ann S h n  
2653 Montcvdlo Rod 
Mountain Bmak, Alabam 35223 

9. Anr timc ~eriod m k d  in a notice wlll bc wmwud fmm the timc the notice Is 
deemed .~ither.pan~ may chnngc i u  mailing o d h  b the individual to noeivc notice 
by wtirying thc other pmy u provided in ~ h b  wwaph. 

10. No onl  aprremcnt or sommunication wlth any ofiar.  occnt. employee. or 
w ~ l l a n t o f  the City either before or after execution of Uis Apncmem will affect or modifi any 
of thc Iama or obli&atioru conmined in this AgramenL Any such onl eprrcmcnI or 
eommunicalion will be wruidmd as unofficial informDtion and in no way bindinp u p  City or 
CantmcIor. Any ~lcndmcnt  lo lhu Agwmsnt mun be in miling md signed by both pnnies. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, m have hereunto x t  cur ha& urd d s  on this Ihe - 
day of lanuuy. 201s. 

CITY OP MOUNTAIN BROOK. 
A 

Mayor. Clty of Mounuin Bmok 

WITNESSED; 

BY: 

ALL IN MOUNTAIN BROOK 

BY: &&&adLSh/,2. 8 
~ u ~ h o S ~ s c n t  Z 

Print name: 1 P , lus %AM W 
27 x &, 

&, 
C 

January 12,2015 



CI?Y OP MOUNTAIN BROOK 

MEMO 
DATE: January 7,2015 

TO: Mayor 
City Council 
City Manager 

FROM: Dana Hazen, City Planner 

Dm. 0. H.Hn, NCP 
Cily P h n a  
56 C h d  Street 
Mounlnin Bmok, Alalmma 35213 
Telephone: ZW/BmJB21 
Fax: 205.879.6913 
harmd~lnbrmk.org 
www.rntnbmk.org 

RE: Conditional Use - Mountain Brook Chssfit 
2703 Culver Road (previous Little Hardware - original left side of space) 

Sec amshedletter from the applicant regarding the proposed operational hctcristiu.  The hours of 
operation arc primarily early morning and late afternoon (closed from noon-4:W p.m.). There is to be 
only one employee (business owner). Given the fact that Little Hardware employed appnuimately 12 
people during a peak hour and most l i l y  had a similar or greater customer demand (proposed 5-8 
people at one time), thii proposed use represents a dccna~e in parking demand on the subject site. 

The ming ordinance nquircs council approval of service uses as a conditional use, and states that any 
proposed conditional use will be reviewed as to the following: 

Whetha the use would disparately impact public parking in the area; 

Whetha vehicular or pedestrian circulation would be impacted by the use; 

Whether the use is compatible with sumundiig existing uses; 

w Whether the hours of operation or peak traffic times would impacr existing uses. 

Mtn. Brook CrossFit Description Summary for City Council Review Approval 

Hours of operation: Mon-Thurs 6a-12p. 4p-8p 
Fri 6a-12p, 4p-6p 
Sat 9a-l la  
Sun Closed 

My normal busy hours are targeted to be early morning (6a-8a) and evening [Sp-8p). 
During these times, I will have approximately 5-8 people at  any given time. Outside of 
these hours, 1 am either closed entirely, or accommodating 1-2 people in the late morning. 

I am the only employee at this time, and will be for a several months. My aim is to hire 
someone by the summer, but even then it will pretty much be to fill my role during the 
day, so still just one person working at  a time. 

I find that parking along Culver on the west side of the building is the most 
accommodating for me and anyone who will be helping me out  It is away of the front row 
for patrons of the post office, or mine and is easier to get in and out of as well. 

1 hope this covers any concerns that may arise with my business venture. I appreciate the 
opportunity to come to your community and look forward to helping your residents any 
way I can. 

Sincerely, 
Rodney Fulmer 

APPENDIX 4 



Faccudwmmtor 
Ann D. Ayun 

December 15,2014 

AlTN: THE HONORABLE TERRY ODEN, MAYOR 
City of Mountain Brook 
56 Church Street 
Mountain Brook, AL 35209 

Dear Mayor Wen: 

Enclosed you will find the transitlroute service contract between Birmingham Jefferson County Transit 
Authority (MAX) and the City of Mountain Brook for the period of October 1,2014 -September 30, 
2015. Please sign this contract and return to me at the address below. 

Thank you in advance for your time and consideration in this matter. 

Sincerely, 

&& - 
Christy Howard j&ounting/~rocurement Specialist I i  
Birmingham Jefferson County Transit Authorltv lMNl .. , 
P.O. Box 10212 
Birmingham, AL 35202 

TRANSIT SERVICES AGREEMENT 

This Transit Services Agreement ("Agreement") is made and entered into this 
22nd day of -September 2014, by and between the Birmingham-Jefferson County 
Transit Authority, an Alabama public corporation (the "BJCTA") and THE CITY OF 
MOUNTAIN BROOK, ALABAMA, a municipality organized under the laws of the 
state of Alabama (the "City"). 

Recitals 

WHEREAS, the BJCTA is chnrged with providing public transportation service 
in kfferson County, Alabama; 

WHEREAS, Alabama Act 1987-449 provides that any municipality which 
receives service from the BJCTA shall pay for such service based on the total projected 
hours of operation in such municipality, multiplied by the hourly cost of operation of the 
transit system; 

WHEREAS, the City desires to receive transit services h m  the BJCTA; and 

WHEREAS, the BJCTA desires to provide !ransit services to the City. 

Agreement 

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing recitals and other good 
and valuable consideration provided herein, the Parties agree as follows: 

1. The BJCTA agrees to provide transit services in the City for the fiscal year 
beginning on October 1, 2014 and ending on September 30, 2015 (the "Fiscal Year"). 
Transit services will be provided on such routes and schedules as provided on the 
enclosed schedule ("Transit Services"). 

2. The City agrees to pay the BJCTA $87.337.36 for the Transit Services for 
the Fiscal Ytar. This sum represents 1627 hours of Transit Services at a rate of S53.68 
per hour. 

3. The BJCTA will invoice the City at the beginning of the Fiscal Year. The 
City agrees to use its best efforts to pay the BJCTA's invoice by the October 31, 2014 
which occurs during the Fiscal Year. If payment is not received by the November 30, 
2014 which occurs during the Fiscal Year, the City shall advise the BJCTA in writing of 
the reason for the delay and the expected payment date. The BJCTA's Board of 
D i c t o n  may grant a thirtyday extension, and, in that event a second invoice shall be 
sent to the City. In the event that the City does not pay one or both invoices, the 
BJCTA's Board of Directors may direct its staff to commence the process of canceling 
the Transit Services. If the Board should at any time determine to terminate the Transit 
Services because of nonpayment, this Agreement shall be terminated, and a written notice 

APPENDIX 5 



of termination shall serve as authorization for the BJCTA to cease providing Transit 
Services within the City as of the date that the Agreement is terminated. 

4. Notice whenever required or permitted under the provisions of this 
Agreement shall be in writing and shall be deemed to have been given three days after the 
deposit of such notice in the United States Mail, via certified mail, postage prepaid, 
addressed: 

if to BJCTA: 

and, if to City: 

A h :  Executive Director 
Birmingham-Jeffnson County Transit Authority 
Post Office Box 10212 
Birmingham, AL 35202-0212 

P c i + ~  MCUWJCT 
City of Mountain Brook Alabama 
56 Church Street 
Mountain Brook, AL 35213 

ii 5. This Agreement shall be terminated upon the conclusion of the Fiscal 
Year. 

6. The BJCTA and the City do not intend that any benefit inure to a third 
party under any provision of this Agreement. 

7. No Party shall be liable or responsible to the other Party, nor be deemed to 
have defaulted under or breached this Agreement, for any failure or delay in W l i n g  or 
performing any term of this Agreement, when and to the extent such failure or delay is 
caused by or results from acts beyond the affected Party's reawnable control, including, 
without limitation: (a) acts of God; @) flood, fin, earthquake, epidemic or explosion; (c) 
war, invasion, hostilities (whether war is declared or not), terrorist threats or acts, riot or 
other civil unrest; (d) government order or law; (e) actions, embargoes or blockades in 
effect on or after the Effective Date of this Agreement; (0 action by any governmental 
authority such as curfews or imposition of Marshall Law; (g) national or regional 
emergency affecting bus services; (h) strikes or labor stoppages by BJCTA's employees; 
(i) shortage of adequate power or telecommunication facilities; (a "Force Majeure 
Event"). The Party suffering a Force Majeure Event shall give Written notice within 
thirty days of the Force Majeure Event to the other Party, stating the period of time the 
occurrence is expected to continue and shall use diligent efforts to end the failure or delay 
and ensure the effects of such Force Majeure Event an minimized. 

8. In the event that the BJCTA should not provide the Transit Services 
throughout the entire Fiscal Year, the City shall pay a prorated amount to the BJCTA for 
the Transit Services provided up to the date such services cease. To the extent that the 
City has prepaid for such Transit Services, the BJCTA shall r e h d  to the City the 
prorated amount paid by the City for Transit Services not provided by the BJCTA, or the 

BJCTA may provide such Transit Services until the prepayments by the City are 
expended. 

9. This Agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the Parties with 
respect to the subject matter hereof and no modifications hereof shall be effective unless 
executed in writing by duly authorized personnel of the Parties hereto. All previous 
communications between the Parties, whether verbal or written, with reference to the 
subject matter hereof an null and void and an hereby superseded by this Agreement. 

10. Either Psrty's delay in enforcing or exercising or failure to enforce or 
exercise any provision of this Agreement or rights existing hereunder shall not in any 
way be constlued as or constitute a waiver of any such provision or right, or prevent that 
Party thereafter from enforcing each and every other provision or right of this Agreement. 
Any express waiver of any obligation by either Party in any one instance shall not l i t  or 
waiver in any other instance. 

11. All provisions, tenns and conditions of this Agnement shall be deemed to 
be severable in nahm. I t  for any reason, the pmvisions contained herein are held to be 
to any extent invalid or contrary to the Constitution of the State of Alabama or any statute 
or applicable law, then to the extent that such pmvisions are, or shall be, valid and 
enforceable under applicable law, then this A p m e n t  shall be construed and interpreted 
to provide for maximum enforceability under applicable law. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties hereto have caused this Agreement to 
be duly executed by persons duly authorized as the date first written above. 

BIRMINGHAM-JEFFERSON 
COUNTY TRANSIT. A U T H O r n  

M D J ~ A I ~  $ b K  
ALABAMA 

City Clerk Mayor 

APPENDIX 5 



Minute Book 86 

082 b H  

qn13 Xquno3 woola .WW 
Toola ulqunoly umo~umoa 

u n w m  

avn 
msq%upila o m o ~ w o a  

Yd00.6 MU~.Y.MH~- 
r--4wts O l m s - - r n u - a ~ ~  
I O I C I Z C l I O U l h ~ N n O  h O U V X % W  51'18111 

ha ~..-UA 
L W  P==N 

L q  .>f'SU!x ~ye r l  s m ~  

:S@~UWWJOJ * W O O  
1 n ~ t ~ s  .Bw.s. >W *==do w xwc 

ha  -93 
Awl ~~!%-'ll 

L-a aqrl 
L F ~ J ~  w 

L-3 ..-A *Vh: 

: d ~ l l ~  S M O J  
III, ooaab- w o l d  )om mu mr 

' S n O ~ ~ U O J  JWUj  
pn. ~aqm*r qjlm ism pa3q u m n  nv 

.8wew!ao o! JOJ 

mlp a Lpw mu!m WJ D doll m q  3ql I D  =a = 

.dm 
~q~!und l q r  om doll IW 11!a mq ql N W W  
I! 'e!od xu4 F =pun D d d 8  SWI (*PP WI(M c 

. u n o l ~ a p  uoq Lcno Su!p~ul  r! mq 
.np fflw punoqw -qXyuu!n unrarunop n l  
su!p~cn s! mq ow nrcru punoqu~ 'poa.glno 
lo ponDqnl upun lu!od -1 rry, ply 
1 3 ~ 4  a qsw n d  ua!mg qnwn uo Bmpwdyl c 

~ ' h ~ m o L , n J q  
II!~ m q  oql ouql alp a ~ m p n  'uu!ad xup ql JO 
auo u w  r! w!od ID- la *mu+ m d  JI = 

.nu!od xop PIP w 
~ n q  awl= uwod U W ~ J  IE =+ls = FL = 

IYSU 01 U'I 
'dm4 $41 nolr  pex noL d y  smq n fiqloj OL = 

alnpaqas m a  r1q1 peal 01 AOH 

1 
January 12,201 5 



S IOZ 'ZI henuel 

om b~ 

mqnd 

aoora u!s)unow umoaumoa 

4JBd 6asmq aup(Sq 

J!U!13 "!PlJ!W 

avn 
meq3u!w!a UMOJUM~~ 



Minute Book 86 

WEEKDAY OUTBOUND 

W B m m  

8:07 8:10 8:31 8 3 4  8:38 8:55 9:06 9 16 

PM times are in bold 

How to read this Bus Schedule 

=I To foUow a bur trip y w  read across Re page. 
Lan to right. 

3 Tnnas am g h n  at certain polnts along Ra bur 
mute calhd time points. 

1 If your departure or arrival point is blween ona 
of L e  time pomts, srtimata Re time the bur ma 
bt) at your stop. 

-, Depandlng on which dimdion you mrh  to 
trawl, find thal tima p i n t  under Inbound or 
Outbound. Inbound means the bus 1s 
trawling to downtown Biningham Outbound 
means Ra bus is trawlrng away fmm 
downtolll 

2 Whm dash linas appear under a Oms poinl, $1 
means the bus win not stop on La t  partlw'ar 
trip. 

7 Be at L a  bur slop a few minuter early to a l lw  
forarmn In astimating. 

All times Ilsted may vary with weather 
and 

tramc conditions. 

MAX wlll not pmvlde s s w l u  on the 
tollorrlng hellday.: 

NawYeafr Day 
4 L  DT July 
Labor Day 

Thanksgiving Day 
Christmas Day 

MAXrrlll o p n h  the "Saturday' sshmdulo 
on the follovring day.: 

MaAn LuRmr King. Jr Day 
Memorial Day 
Veteran's Day 

PUBClClNFOrUUnW MPAR~MENT :i+.)5210101 
Intanaka Hal..: ll.W m m O W  pn M n d . y ~ . w d a y  

L c a y m  ( I -WM-~Wpn  k4xchr-y 

Effective January 5,2014 

Locations Served: 

Downtown Birmingham 
U AB 

Kirklin Clinic 
Birmingham Botanical Gardens 

Birmingham Zoo 
Downtown Mtn. Brook 
Whole Foods Market 

Hwy 280 
English Village 

January 12,20 15 



M
inute B

ook 86 

January 12,20 15 



Minute Book 86 

STATE OF ALABAMA ) 

JEFFERSON COUNTY ) 

GRANT O F  ACKNOWLEDGMENT. RELEASE. 
AND INDEMNIFICATION INSTRUMENT 

RE: 405 Club Place. Mountain Brook. Alabama 

This GranlofAJLno~\~Iedgm~nt, RcIensc, and lndcmnifieotion Instrumctis madeby S u m  

8 .  Riltsr ("Ownd') in favor of lhe CityofMountain Bmok. Alabama.a municipal mrporulion (the 

.City.). 

WHEREAS. thc O m a  onns pmpsny lhal is localcd a 405 Club Plos. Mountain Bmok. 

Alabama 31223, more panieularly d-bed s s  followvs: 

Unit 6.2nd Amendmcnl lo Club Place, s s  
raordcd in Map Book 21 1. P q c  63 in lhc 
Ofice of the Judgc of Robale. J e B m n  
Cwnty. Alabama 

WHEREAS.lhc Owmcrapplicd for and rcesi\.d a building permit from IheCitylo wnstruel 

a residence louted on lhc R o w  (the 'Project'); and 

WHEREAS, during lhc wnsrmuion pmccu, Onner was required to inudl a wmplex 

walcrpmofmg syalcm lo milipnlc lhc deus of an underground streom on lhc Pmpaiy; and 

WHEREAS. lhc Project funha  includes a basement lo house mschnnicd qu ipmaland  a 

wine storage m a :  and 

WHEREAS. Scetion R310.1 of the 2012 Intsmalional Residentid Code (the "Codc") 

ineludes mcrpncyescapcand nwucopa ing  requircmenls for bucmenu and the Rojmdocr not 

wmply with said wdc m i o n ;  and 

WHEREAS. Owma has ~ r n t e d  thu stria wmplimw wilh Ss t ion  R3IO.I of lhc Codc 

would compromise the intsprity of the w s e r p m r i g  system for lhc basement, is not pnrl iublc 

given the silcconfiguntion. and would k wst  prohibitive; and 

WHEREAS. the Owmer hm rcqueslcd thal lhc City approve ils Final Inspection md issue a 

Knificalc of aevpanw at b e  approprints timc and in ~ccordnnw with odininy practice 

nohvilhrlnndingthecodc-compliance i u u a  b a d .  in pati, on Ow~mda m e n 1  ha1 l h c b s a ~ e n t  

shdl notwnlain my habitable m and tha  it m a  

for wine u o w c ;  and 

WHEREAS. RIM.10 of lhc Code allavs for modifiealion lo codc nqu imenls  upon a 

finding lhal lhcshiu applualion ofthc Codc is impnrticd and lhc proposed modification mmplra 

wilh the intent and purposeofthe Code, without wmpmmisinghedlh, life and safs*.rcqui~rmau; 

and 

WHEREAS. h e  building oficial a m  thal. due lo thc silc conditions, such pnsucal 

difienltia arc p m n t  and that modification lo the Code will bc pcrmillcd under the o x p m  

condition that ihc bucmenl ma).only k utilized lo h o u r  mechanical equipment and forslorweof 

wine o ro lha  perishable goods. but lhal in no instance shall i l k  ulilirrd s s  habitable apos; and 

WHEREAS. lhc Cily hss r g d  not lo wilhhold issuance of a Csrtifualc of Occupansy 

based solely on the failure lo wmply with R310.I Xthe h n u  rclinowledpn Md w s  to& of 

the klowcnumeralsd understandings byowuling and wording this Instrument in the MI propen)' 

w a r d s  for lhc Robats Coun of khS011 County, Alabama 

NOW, THEREFORE, for and in sonsidenlion of b e  above premises and the mutual 

covenmu and a g m e n u s e l  fonh herein. and f o r o l h e r g m d d  vduable wnsidmlion. t h e m i p t  

and sufieicnsy of which is ackno\vlcdgcd. lhc cckno~vIedges and (~g l f~s  s s  follo~vs: 

I. The bolcmenl of lhe midcnceconMlclcd on b e  Ropcrlyshall only bc ulilirsd lo 

house mechmicd equnpmcnl. for the slorsge ofwlnc orolhcr likc pnshablc goods, and forocccu 

lhcmo provided, ho\\.evcr, lhat the barmen1 shdl under no areumslnnces k uscd, occupied or 

improved ss habiiablc space. 

2. Owner, on kha l f  of l~crrelf and h a  susccum-an-litlc and assigns. hereby forever 

releases, cxonernses. and dimhorger the C~ty, and lu ofieids, mploycer, agents, md  

rcpmenlalivcs (thc " R c l d  Partlcs") in lhcirofieid and mdividualsnpacilies from any and ever) 

claim. action. suit, demand. judgnteni. mst, fce, expense, or liability of an)- knnd or c h w a r  

\vhawcver arising out ofor relating to v~oladonsof lhc Codc or lhc Cily's approval ofand inuancc 

of a certificate of occupmw for lhc Rqscl .  

3. Ownn, on behalf of h m d f  and herrucccssan-in-dtle and sssigns. further a m  to 

indentnify.dcfend and hald h m l n r  the Rcleascd Parties from. sgainsl. and wilh respccl to any and 

e\.ery claim. action. suit. demand, judgmcnt. colt, fce, cxpcna (~ncluding, but not limited lo, 

r c m ~ b l c  attorneys' f e u  or w u n  COSU) or liability of any kind or eharcclcr thal mu). be assericd. 

imposed or made by lhc ~ U K ,  hasucecuon-in-lillcor assigns, any guuu. Icsrssr, oroccvpanls 

of lhe rsridcncc on the P m p W  or by any olher penon or entity ss a ruult of or by r e m n  of any 

claimcd b m h  of lcgd duly arising out of or relating lo violation of lhe Codc. 

4. Owvnerspccifiedly acknowledges and a p r c ~ ~  ha the Cily hasno legal obl~pnt~on to 

i w c  its approval and a cuiifieats O ~ O C C U P M ~  upon rmal inspection for the Project because thc 

plans and intended work do not strictly wmply with Section R.3IO.I of lhc Code and, funher, thal 

my  rush approval is pmnirsd and conditioned on theexprsrr wvenanl lhal the basemenldtall k 

only u d  lo house mechanical qu ipn~en l  and forstorppe ofwincorolha like perishablegoods but 

unda no eireumhonca shdl il bc " t i l i d  or occupied as habitable spos.  

1. Owmerspecifiedly aeknavledges and ggraslhat. R.310.1 is lheonly section ofthe 

Codc k ing  modificd hcreby and that d l  olher applicable Code provisions shall continue lo apply 

with full force and elTat. 

6. This Gmnl of Acknowledgnsnl. Relcase. and lndmnificalion lnstrumenl shall k 

d c d  in the probalc r a o d s  of Jellenon County. Alabama, and shall kdscn~cd  lo k a  wvenml 

uld obligation of (hvnalhal mns wilh the Imd. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, lhc Onncrhss caused this inrVumcnl lo bc cxeculcd on this h e  

- d q  of .2011. 

STATE OF ALABAMA ) 
JEFFERSON COUNTY ) 

I. lhe vndcnigned aulhority,a Nolnryhblie in and for said counlyand slats, hcrebyeenify 
that Susan 8 .  Ritter whose n a l c  is signcd lo h e  foregoing inst~ntcnl  and who 8s h o s n  lo me. 
rkno\\ .M~ed bcforc me thal. bcinu informed o f iu  wnlcnls.shecxeculd lhcmmc volunlaril\~. on . - 
the day thernmc km dale. 

Given under my hand and oficial s u l  on this thc - dny of- 201 5. 

January 12,20 15 


